
  
 

 

12 South Center Street 
Bensenville, IL 60106 
 
Office: 630.766.8200 
Fax: 630.350.3434 
www.bensenville.il.us  
 

 

VILLAGE BOARD 
 
President 
Frank Soto 
 
Trustees 
Morris Bartlett 
Susan V. Janowiak 
Robert “Bob” Jarecki 
Martin O’Connell 
JoEllen Ridder 
Henry Wesseler 
 
Village Clerk 
Ilsa Rivera- Trujillo 
 
Village Manager 
Michael J. Cassady 

                This memorandum contains preliminary drafts, notes, recommendations and other records 
of the Bensenville Village Manager, expressing opinions, and designed and intended to assist 
in the formation of Village policy.  It is therefore confidential and intended only for members 
of the Village Board and senior management. 

 
MANAGER’S MEMORANDUM 

 
TO:   Mayor and Village Board of Trustees 
 
FROM:                Mike Cassady, Village Manager 
 
DATE:   June 6, 2013 
    
SUBJECT:  June 11, 2013 Meeting:  

Board of Trustees 
Infrastructure and Environment 
Public Safety 
Community & Economic Development 

             
 
 

Village of Bensenville, Illinois 
     BOARD OF TRUSTEES   

 MEETING AGENDA  
6:30 P.M.  Tuesday, June 11, 2013 

Bensenville Village Hall, 12 S. Center Street, Bensenville IL  60106 

            
            
I. CALL TO ORDER  
 
II.  PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE        
  
III. ROLL CALL 
           
IV. PUBLIC COMMENT (3 minutes per person with a 30 minute meeting limitation)  
           
V. APPROVAL OF MINUTES  

 May 28, 2013 Board of Trustees   

http://www.bensenville.il.us/


 

 
VI.  WARRANT – June 11, 2013 #13/10 $1,173,534.13  
  
 
VII.     CONSENT AGENDA – CONSIDERATION OF AN “OMNIBUS VOTE” 
 

1. Ordinance Adopting  the 2012 Illinois Energy Code and Amendments to 
the 2008 National Code 

2. Ordinance Approving a Conditional Use Permit Amendment to Ordinance 
#83-2012 for Sirus XM to Allow the Installation of an Additional Antenna 
Above 35’ Located at 602 N. York Road, Bensenville, Illinois, Illinois 
American Tower in an Existing C – 4 Regional Destination PUD 
Commercial District 

VIII.  REPORTS OF STANDING COMMITTEES 

A. Community and Economic Development Committee – No Report  

B. Infrastructure and Environment Committee – No Report 
   

C. Administration, Finance and Legislation Committee – No Report  

 D.   Public Safety Committee – No Report 

E.   Recreation and Community Building Committee – No Report 
 
 F.  Technology Committee – No Report 
 
  
   IX. REPORTS OF VILLAGE OFFICERS:  

A. PRESIDENT'S REMARKS: None 

B. VILLAGE MANAGER'S REPORT: None 

C. VILLAGE ATTORNEY’S REPORT: None 

   X.  UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

  XI.  NEW BUSINESS 

 XII.     EXECUTIVE SESSION 

  



 

  

 A. Review of Executive Session Minutes [5 ILCS 120/2 (C)(21)]  

 B. Personnel [5 ILCS 120/2(C)(1)] 

 C. Collective Bargaining [5 ILCS 120/2 (C)(2)]  

 D. Property Acquisition [5 ILCS 120/2(C)(5)]  

 E. Litigation [5 ILCS 120/2(C)(11)] 

XIII.  MATTERS REFERRED FROM EXECUTIVE SESSION 

XIV.  ADJOURNMENT       
  
 

 
INFRASTRUCTURE AND ENVIRONMENT  

COMMITTEE MEETING 
AGENDA  

 6:45 P.M. – Or Immediately Following The Community & 
Economic Development Committee Meeting 

  
Call to Order 
Roll Call 
Approval of Minutes:   May 21, 2013 
        
ACTION ITEMS 

 
1. Consideration of a Resolution to Approve the Contract Terms Amending the 

Residential Solid Waste, Yard Waste and Recycling Services Agreement with 
Republic Services (F/K/A Allied Waste)  

At their May 21, 2013 meeting, the I&E Committee authorized staff to negotiate a 
contract extension with Republic Services (F/K/A Allied Waste).  Republic has 
been the Village’s waste hauler since 2001 and their current contract expires on 
September 30, 2013.  After negotiating with Republic over the past few weeks, we 
have come to agreement on a recommended contract extension that addresses all 
of the Village’s requests.  Most notably, the new contract reduces rates across the 
board by 10.4%, including an 8.1% reduction for single-family residences.  In 
addition the new contract introduces a 15% senior discount. Other contract 



 

components include introduction of 65-gallon rolling recycling bins with the 
option of increasing to 95-gallon at no charge, annual increases tied to the CPI-
Transportation Index with a floor of 2% and a max of 5%, and a 63 month 
contract term realigning the contract with the Village’s calendar year 
budget.  Based on Republic’s excellent customer service and ability to provide 
Bensenville refuse rates at 2011 levels that are lower than our neighboring 
communities, staff recommends approval of the proposed contract terms. 
 

2. As Submitted 

INFORMATIONAL ITEMS 

Adjournment 

 
 PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE MEETING 

AGENDA  
7:00 P.M. – Tuesday, June 11, 2013 

  
Call to Order 
Pledge of Allegiance   
Roll Call 
Approval of Minutes:  May 21, 2013 
   
ACTION ITEMS 

1. Consideration of  Allowing Video Gaming in the Village of Bensenville  
 
At the May 21, 2013 Public Safety Committee Meeting Trustee Wesseler asked 
that Video Gaming be reconsidered at the next Committee Meeting.  Video 
Gaming was last discussed by the Board on January 22, 2013 at which time the 
decision to place an advisory referendum question related to Video Gaming was 
tabled.  Staff has updated the information presented at that time to the Board in 
the materials for this item.  Included is a map of the nearby communities allowing 
Video Gaming as well as revenue generation information. We estimate the Village 
could receive approximately $75,000/year from Video Gaming.  Chief Kosman is 
surveying communities that allow Video Gaming to assess the impact on public 



 

safety and he will report to the Committee on Tuesday.  When he last checked in 
January no issues were reported. 

2. As Submitted 

INFORMATIONAL ITEMS 

1. Discussion Regarding Taqueria Mi Tierra Application for a Class E2 
Liquor License  
 
Taqueria Mi Tierra, located at 459 W. Irving Park Road, requests an E2 liquor 
license.  E2 licenses authorize restaurant facilities to sell beer and wine for 
consumption on premises.  At this time, Cancun Mexican Restaurant is our only 
taqueria with a liquor license.  Staff has concerns about issuing this liquor 
license, which would fundamentally change the use of this business.  Action on 
this request is at the discretion of the Committee.   

2. Discussion Regarding Main Street News Stand, LLC Application 
Request for a Class F Liquor License 
 
Main Street News Stand & Smoke Shop, located at 119 W. Main Street, requests a 
Class F liquor license.    F licenses authorize the retail sale of packaged beer and 
wine only by grocers for off-premise consumption.  Staff has concerns about 
issuing this liquor license, which would fundamentally change the use of this 
business.  Action on this request is at the discretion of the Committee. 

Adjournment 
 
 

COMMUNITY & ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE 
MEETING 
AGENDA  

7:15 P.M. Or Immediately Following the Board of Trustees 
Meeting  

 
Call to Order 
Roll Call 
Approval of Minutes:  May 21, 2013 



 

      
 
ACTION ITEMS 

 
1. Consideration of Eliminating Real Estate Transfer Inspections (RETI) Except 

in Cases of Foreclosures 

Real Estate Transfer Inspections (RETI) are property inspections conducted by 
the Village whenever residential dwellings are sold.  We have long been criticized 
for conducting these inspections which are seen as redundant with independent 
home inspections, cause realtors to avoid showings in Bensenville, and are seen 
as government overreach.  Most recently during our “Discover Bensenville” 
focus groups with realtors there was a consensus from the group for us to 
eliminate RETIs.    During the October 13, 2012 Budget Workshop, the Village 
Board supported elimination of the RETI.  At this time staff recommends that the 
RETI be eliminated except for foreclosed properties.  Foreclosures are not owner 
occupied and often have property maintenance complaints and life safety 
issues.  Under this scenario the Village would focus our efforts more on 
completing our annual rental inspections.  Staff recommends approval of 
eliminating RETIs except for foreclosed properties.   
 

2. As Submitted  

INFORMATIONAL ITEMS 

1. Discussion Regarding Creation of a Façade Improvement Program  

The Village Board included the creation of a façade improvement program in the 
2013 Strategic Plan and budgeted $30,000 for the program in 2013 as well.  The 
purpose of the program would be to provide assistance to local businesses to 
visually upgrade and enhance their property. Staff recommends issuing up to 
$10,000 per grantee for eligible expenses such as canopies or awnings, signage, 
new façade elements, exterior lighting and entryway improvements. Another 
requirement would be that all building façade work shall front on public 
streets.  This is a discussion item and staff recommends that the Committee 
provide input for staff to draft a more formal façade program.   

 
2.  Discussion Regarding a Review of Current Zoning Ordinance Requirements 

for Detached Garages and Sheds 



 

 
At the request of Trustee Jarecki, staff presents a review of Section 10-14-12 of 
the Village Code, which regulates the size of garages and sheds in residential 
districts.  Currently the size of detached garages are regulated by the size of the 
lot, while sheds are limited to 100 sq. ft. The conflict in the Code is that the 
combined total of both accessory structures is limited to the size of the garage, 
which means a resident cannot maximize their garage size and have a 
shed.  Presumably this limitation is intended to preserve open space in rear yards 
for aesthetic purposes.  If the Committee is inclined to increase the allowable size 
of accessory structures in residential areas, a possible amendment would be to 
increase the limit by 100 sqft. to allow a shed.  This is a discussion item and staff 
recommends that the Committee evaluate the impact of this Code section and 
whether it should be amended.   

 
Adjournment  

 
 
 
 



  
 

 

12 South Center Street 
Bensenville, IL 60106 
 
Office: 630.766.8200 
Fax: 630.350.3434 
www.bensenville.il.us  
 

 

VILLAGE BOARD 
 
President 
Frank Soto 
 
Trustees 
Morris Bartlett 
Susan V. Janowiak 
Robert “Bob” Jarecki 
Martin O’Connell 
JoEllen Ridder 
Henry Wesseler 
 
Village Clerk 
Ilsa Rivera- Trujillo 
 
Village Manager 
Michael J. Cassady 

Village of Bensenville, Illinois 
     BOARD OF TRUSTEES   

 MEETING AGENDA  
6:30 P.M.  Tuesday, June 11, 2013 

Bensenville Village Hall, 12 S. Center Street, Bensenville IL  60106 

            
            
I. CALL TO ORDER  
 
II.  PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE        
  
III. ROLL CALL 
           
IV. PUBLIC COMMENT (3 minutes per person with a 30 minute meeting limitation)  
           
V. APPROVAL OF MINUTES  

 May 28, 2013 Board of Trustees   
 
VI.  WARRANT – June 11, 2013 #13/10 $1,173,534.13  
  
 
VII.     CONSENT AGENDA – CONSIDERATION OF AN “OMNIBUS VOTE” 
 

1. Ordinance Adopting  the 2012 Illinois Energy Code and Amendments to 
the 2008 National Code 

2. Ordinance Approving a Conditional Use Permit Amendment to Ordinance 
#83-2012 for Sirus XM to Allow the Installation of an Additional Antenna 
Above 35’ Located at 602 N. York Road, Bensenville, Illinois, Illinois 
American Tower in an Existing C – 4 Regional Destination PUD 
Commercial District 

VIII.  REPORTS OF STANDING COMMITTEES 

A. Community and Economic Development Committee – No Report  

B. Infrastructure and Environment Committee – No Report 
   

C. Administration, Finance and Legislation Committee – No Report  

 D.   Public Safety Committee – No Report 



12 South Center Street 
Bensenville, IL 60106 
 
Office: 630.766.8200 
Fax: 630.350.3434 
www.bensenville.il.us  

 

 E.   Recreation and Community Building Committee – No Report 
 
 F.  Technology Committee – No Report 
 
  
   IX. REPORTS OF VILLAGE OFFICERS:  

A. PRESIDENT'S REMARKS: None 

B. VILLAGE MANAGER'S REPORT: None 

C. VILLAGE ATTORNEY’S REPORT: None 

   X.  UNFINISHED BUSINESS 

  XI.  NEW BUSINESS 

 XII.     EXECUTIVE SESSION 

 A. Review of Executive Session Minutes [5 ILCS 120/2 (C)(21)]  

 B. Personnel [5 ILCS 120/2(C)(1)] 

 C. Collective Bargaining [5 ILCS 120/2 (C)(2)]  

 D. Property Acquisition [5 ILCS 120/2(C)(5)]  

 E. Litigation [5 ILCS 120/2(C)(11)] 

XIII.  MATTERS REFERRED FROM EXECUTIVE SESSION 

XIV.  ADJOURNMENT       
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Village of Bensenville
Board Room

12 South Center Street
Bensenville, Illinois 60106

Counties of DuPage and Cook

MINUTES OF THE VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES MEETING
May 28, 2013

CALL TO ORDER: 1. President Soto called the meeting to order at 6:33 p.m.

ROLL CALL: 2. Upon roll call by Village Clerk, Ilsa River-Trujillo, the
following Board Members were present:

Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

Absent: None

A quorum was present.

PUBLIC COMMENT: There was no public comment.

APPROVAL OF
MINUTES: 3. The May 7, 2013 Village Board Meeting #1 minutes were

presented.

Motion: Trustee Bartlett made a motion to approve the minutes as
presented. Trustee Ridder seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

The May 7, 2013 Village Board Meeting #2 minutes were
presented.

Motion: Trustee O’Connell made a motion to approve the minutes as
presented. Trustee Wesseler seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

WARRANT NO.
13/09: 4. President Soto presented Warrant No. 13/09 in the amount of

$3,250,236.26.

Motion: Trustee Bartlett made a motion to approve the warrant as presented.
Trustee Ridder seconded the motion.



Minutes of the Special Village Board Meeting
May 28, 2013 Page 2

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Motion: 5. Trustee Bartlett made a motion to set the Consent Agenda as
presented. Trustee Wesseler seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Ordinance No.
33-2013: An Ordinance Authorizing the Execution of the Illinois Public

Works Mutual Aid Network Agreement (IPWMAN) (Consent
Agenda)

Resolution No.
R-63-2013: A Resolution Authorizing the Execution of an Engineering

Services Agreement with Engineering Enterprises, Inc. for the
Wood Avenue Watermain and Street Improvement Project (Volk
Brothers Phase III) in the Not to Exceed Amount of $115,681.
(Consent Agenda)

Ordinance No.
34-2013: An Ordinance Adopting a Revised DuPage County Stormwater

Management Ordinance and Amending Title 9, Chapter 14,
Section 1 of the Bensenville Village Code. (Consent Agenda)\

Resolution No.
R-64-2013: A Resolution Authorizing the Payment for the Annual Northeast

DuPage Youth and Family Services Contribution for Fiscal Year
2013. (Consent Agenda)

Resolution No.
R-65-2013: A Resolution Appropriating Additional Funds in the Amount of

$727,367.68 For Improvements Completed as Part of the Section
#00-00081-00-PK to Resolve the Discrepancy Discovered During
the Audit of the Village’s Motor Fuel Tax (MFT) Funds. (Consent
Agenda)

Resolution No.
R-66-2013: A Resolution Appropriating Additional Funds in the Amount of

$131,034.89 For Improvements Completed as Part of the Section
#96-00077-00-FP to Resolve the Discrepancy Discovered During
the Audit of the Village’s Motor Fuel Tax (MFT) Funds. (Consent
Agenda)



Minutes of the Special Village Board Meeting
May 28, 2013 Page 3

Resolution No.
R-67-2013: A Resolution Appropriating Additional Funds in the Amount of

$779,593.86 For Improvements Completed as Part of the Section
#96-00078-00-FP to Resolve the Discrepancy Discovered During
the Audit of the Village’s Motor Fuel Tax (MFT) Funds. (Consent
Agenda)

Motion: Trustee Bartlett made a motion to approve the Consent Agenda as
presented. Trustee Ridder seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Ordinance No.
35-2013: 6. President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Ordinance No. 35-2013 entitled An Ordinance Amending
Ordinance No. 28-98 Adopted May 19, 1998, As Well As The
Redevelopment Project Area Legal Description Attached
Thereto As Exhibit A, The Map of the Redevelopment Project
Area Legal Description Attached Thereto As Exhibit C, and the
Redevelopment Plan and Project Attached Thereto as Exhibit D,
in Regard to Correcting Certain Scrivener’s Errors Extending
the Life of the Village of Bensenville’s Grand Avenue Tax
Increment Financing District (TIF #4) and to Address
Redevelopment During the Extended Life of Said Tax Increment
Financing District Beyond Its Original Termination Date.

Motion: Trustee Bartlett made a motion to table this item until a future Village
Board Meeting. Trustee Jarecki seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.



Minutes of the Special Village Board Meeting
May 28, 2013 Page 4

Ordinance No.
36-2013: 7. President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Ordinance No. 36-2013 entitled An Ordinance Amending
Ordinance No. 29-98 Adopted May 19, 1998, By Revising The
Redevelopment Project Area Legal Description Attached
Thereto As Exhibit A, and The Map of the Redevelopment
Project Area Legal Description Attached Thereto As Exhibit C,
Relative to the Designation of the Redevelopment Project Area
in Regard to the Village of Bensenville’s Grand Avenue Tax
Increment Financing District (TIF #4) to Correct Certain
Scrivener’s Errors Therein.

Motion: Trustee Ridder made a motion to table this item until a future Village
Board Meeting. Trustee Bartlett seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Ordinance No.
37-2013: 8. President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Ordinance No. 37-2013 entitled An Ordinance Amending
Ordinance No. 30-98 Adopted May 19, 1998, By Revising The
Redevelopment Project Area Legal Description Attached
Thereto As Exhibit A, and The Map of the Redevelopment
Project Area Legal Description Attached Thereto As Exhibit C,
Relative to Adopting Tax Increment Financing in Regard to the
Village of Bensenville’s Grand Avenue Tax Increment Financing
District (TIF #4) to Correct Certain Scrivener’s Errors Therein.

Motion: Trustee Wesseler made a motion to table this item until a future
Village Board Meeting. Trustee Ridder seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.



Minutes of the Special Village Board Meeting
May 28, 2013 Page 5

PRESIDENT’S
REMARKS:

Resolution No
R-68-2013: 9. President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Resolution No. R-68-2013 entitled A Resolution Granting the
Advice and Consent of Trustees to the Village President’s Re-
Appointment of Village Trustee JoEllen Ridder to the Village of
Bensenville Community Youth Services Coalition.

Motion: Trustee Janowiak made a motion to approve the resolution as
presented. Trustee Wesseler seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Resolution No
R-69-2013: 10.President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Resolution No. R-69-2013 entitled A Resolution Granting the
Advice and Consent of Trustees to the Village President’s Re-
Appointment of Police Chief Frank Kosman to the Village of
Bensenville Community Youth Services Coalition.

Motion: Trustee Wesseler made a motion to approve the resolution as
presented. Trustee Janowiak seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Resolution No
R-70-2013: 11.President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Resolution No. R-70-2013 entitled A Resolution Granting the
Advice and Consent of Trustees to the Village President’s Re-
Appointment of Village Manager Michael Cassady to the Village
of Bensenville Community Youth Services Coalition.

Motion: Trustee Ridder made a motion to approve the resolution as
presented. Trustee Janowiak seconded the motion.



Minutes of the Special Village Board Meeting
May 28, 2013 Page 6

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Resolution No
R-71-2013: 12.President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Resolution No. R-71-2013 entitled A Resolution Granting the
Advice and Consent of Trustees to the Village President’s Re-
Appointment of Village Manager Michael Cassady to the Office
of Village Treasurer.

Motion: Trustee Wesseler made a motion to approve the resolution as
presented. Trustee Janowiak seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Trustee Ridder read a proclamation into the record in honor of
Barbara Wanzung.

President Soto announced he has appointed Village Trustee Susan
Janowiak to serve as the Village’s Representative on the Community
Foundation.

MANAGERS
REPORT:

Resolution No
R-72-2013: 13.President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Resolution No. R-72-2013 entitled A Resolution Authorizing the
Repair of a 2000 John Deere Backhoe with West Side Tractor on
the Not to Exceed Amount of $19,273.95.

Motion: Trustee Ridder made a motion to approve the resolution as
presented. Trustee Bartlett seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.



Minutes of the Special Village Board Meeting
May 28, 2013 Page 7

VILLAGE ATTORNEY
REPORT: Village Attorney, Pat Bond, had no report.

UNFINISHED
BUSINESS: There was no unfinished business.

NEW BUSINESS: Trustee Bartlett provided an update on the traveling Memorial Wall
and asked for volunteers.

Trustee Ridder announced flags for the Memorial Wall will be on sale
soon and more information can be found on the Village’s Website.

Trustee Janowiak provided an update in regards to the May 28, 2013
Art Council Meeting.

Trustee Janowiak announced there is will be a pig roast at White
Pine Golf Corse on June 8, 2013 with proceeds going to the Wall that
Heels.

Trustee Janowiak announced on May 30, 2013 Blackhawk School
will be hosting Mc-Teachers night at McDonalds on Route 83 and
Foster.

Trustee Janowiak announced on May 31, 2013 Dunkin Donuts on
Irving Park Road will be holding an event for the Special Olympics.

President Soto asked Staff to explore the possibility of extending
Pride Week in Bensenville.

EXECUTIVE
SESSION: Village Attorney, Pat Bond, called for an Executive Session for the

purpose of discussing pending, probable, or imminent litigation,
acquisition of real estate property, personnel, and collective
negotiating matters. Action will take place as a result of the
discussions.

Motion: Trustee Ridder made a motion to recess the meeting and go into
Executive Session. Trustee Bartlett seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

President Soto recessed the meeting at 7:05 p.m.



Minutes of the Special Village Board Meeting
May 28, 2013 Page 8

President Soto called the meeting back to order at 9:03 p.m.

ROLL CALL: Upon roll call by Village Clerk, Ilsa River-Trujillo, the
following Board Members were present:

Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

Absent: None

A quorum was present.

Resolution No
R-73-2013: 13.President Soto gave the summarization of the action contemplated in

Resolution No. R-73-2013 entitled A Approving the Execution of
an Agreement Between the Village of Bensenville and Michael J.
Cassady for Services As Village Manager.

Motion: Trustee Ridder made a motion to approve the resolution subject to
Attorney Review. Trustee Bartlett seconded the motion.

ROLL CALL: AYES: Bartlett, Janowiak, Jarecki, O’Connell, Ridder, Wesseler

NAYS: None

All were in favor. Motion carried.

ADJOURNMENT: Trustee Ridder made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Trustee
Wesseler seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

President Soto adjourned the meeting at 9:07 p.m.

Ilsa Rivera-Trujillo
Village Clerk
PASSED AND APPROVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Bensenville this day, June, 2013



















































TYPE:    Ordinance              SUBMITTED BY:             M. Rysavy                  DATE: _06.11.13 
 
DESCRIPTION: Ordinance adopting the 2012 Illinois Energy Code and Amendments to the 2008 
National Electric Code 
 

SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 
 Financially Sound Village X Enrich the lives of Residents 
X Quality Customer Oriented Services  Major Business/Corporate Center 
X Safe and Beautiful Village  Vibrant Major Corridors 
 
COMMITTEE ACTION: CEDC (approved 6-0)  DATE:  05.21.13 
 
BACKGROUND: As part of Village's Strategic Planning goals, Community and Economic Development 
was tasked with the streamlining and simplification of our codes and processes. As our Inspectors 
interact with businesses, residents, and property owners throughout the year, it is our responsibility to 
listen to their comments and adjust our codes and procedures where it makes good sense. Some of those 
discussions have led to these proposed code amendments. The CEDC voted unanimously (6-0) to 
approve the proposed amendments. 
 
KEY ISSUES: The first amendment is to the 2008 National Electrical Code.  These proposed 
amendments are proposed based on feedback from our customers, including:  

· Elimination of the requirement for all metal construction for emergency and exit signs;  
· Modifying the closet lighting requirements; and  
· Prohibition on prefabricated office cubicles. 

 
The other proposed amendments stem from the practicality of more modern materials and their 
application to our particular conditions within the Village. The best example of this would be the 
addition of PVC conduit as an allowable use underground. With the acidic soil conditions native to this 
Village, metal conduits degrade very quickly. All of these amendments have been compared to our 
neighboring Municipalities and are in line with their requirements.  
 
Also included with this agenda item is the proposed adoption of the 2012 Illinois Energy Code, which 
has been mandated by the State of Illinois. It utilizes the 2012 International Energy Code, but builds in 
some requirements that are more specific to the State and our local climate. 
 
The goal of this Strategic Plan item is to ensure the Village is providing the best service to our 
customers and not inhibiting their growth and potential, while still protecting their safety and welfare. 
With these proposed amendments to the 2008 National Electric Code, Staff feels we are helping the 
everyday user, while still maintaining the life safety and building code requirements necessary for the 
long term success of each project and the Village overall. As for the Energy Code, this adoption is 
required by the State of Illinois. 
 
ALTERNATIVES:  

1. Approve the Ordinance as submitted 
2. Discretion of the Board 

  
RECOMMENDATION:  Staff respectfully recommends approval of the Ordinance as submitted 
 
BUDGET IMPACT: No budget impact 
 
ACTION REQUIRED:  Motion to approve an Ordinance adopting the 2012 Illinois Energy Code and 
Amendments to the 2008 National Electric Code 



AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING AMENDMENTS  
TO BUILDING CODE REGULATIONS,  

AS SET  FORTH IN TITLE 9 CHAPTERS 5 AND 6  
OF THE BENSENVILLE VILLAGE CODE 

 
 WHEREAS, the Village of Bensenville (“Village”) is a municipality duly organized and 
operating under the Illinois Municipal Code, 65 ILCS 5/1-1-1 et seq., and 

 
WHEREAS, the Village is authorized and empowered, under the Municipal Code and the 

Code of Ordinances of the Village of Bensenville, to regulate properties located within the 
municipal boundaries of the Village; and 
 

WHEREAS, in furtherance of this authorization, the Village has adopted a Building 
Code, which is set forth in Title 9 of the Bensenville Village Code of Ordinances, to control all 
matters concerning the construction, alteration, additions, repair, removal, demolition, use, 
location, occupancy and maintenance of all buildings and structures; and 

 
WHEREAS, staff has reviewed provisions of Title 9, specifically those providing for 

energy conservation as set for in Chapter 5 of Title 9, and electrical provisions as set forth in 
Chapter 6 of Title 9 and has recommend that the Village Board adopt revisions to these 
regulations which are in keeping with current Illinois and national code provisions; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Village Board has reviewed the recommendations of Village staff and 

believe it is in the best interests of the residents of the Village to amend existing provisions 
concerning energy conservation and electrical regulations. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the 

Village of Bensenville, DuPage and Cook County, Illinois, assembled in a duly noticed regular 
meeting: 
 
 SECTION ONE: That the foregoing recitals are hereby incorporated by reference as if 
fully set forth. 

 SECTION TWO: That Title 9 Building Regulations, Chapter 5 Electrical Code is 
hereby repealed as presently stated, in its entirety, and replaced in total, in its entirety, with 
Chapter 5 Electrical Code, attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit “A;” and  

 SECTION THREE:  That Title 9 Building Regulations, Chapter 6 Energy Conservation 
Code is hereby repealed in its entirety, and replaced in total, in its entirety, with the 2012 Illinois 
Energy Conservation Code, amended to state as follows: 

9-6-1: CODE ADOPTED:  
 
The 2012 Illinois energy conservation code (2012 International Energy 
Conservation Code plus Illinois Amendments) published by the International 



Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated, in its entirety, subject to the 
amendments set forth in section 9-6-2 of this chapter.  
 
9-6-2: AMENDMENTS TO THE ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE:  
 

Chapter 1 - Administration 

101.1.  Section C101.1 Title. Revise as follows: 

    This code shall be known as the Illinois Energy Conservation Code of the village 
of Bensenville, and shall be cited as such.  It is referred to herein as “this code.” 

 R101 Chapter 1[RE] – Scope and General Requirements 

 R101.1 Section R101.1 Title. Revise as follows: 

 This code shall be known as the Energy Conservation Code of the Village of 
Bensenville, and shall be cited as such.  It is referred to herein as “this code.” 

 SECTION FOUR:  That all other ordinances and resolutions, or parts thereof, in 
conflict with the provisions of this Ordinance, are, to the extent of such conflict, expressly 
repealed. 

SECTION FIVE: Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, 
approval, and publication in pamphlet form as provided by law. 

 
PASSED AND APPROVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of 

Bensenville, this 11th day of June, 2013. 

 

     ____________________________________ 
      Frank Soto, Village President 

ATTEST: 
 
 
_________________________ 
Ilsa Rivera-Trujillo, Village Clerk 
    
AYES:________________________________________________________________ 
 
NAYES:_______________________________________________________________ 
 
ABSENT:______________________________________________________________ 



 VILLAGE OF BENSENVILLE 
 
 AMENDMENTS TO  
 THE 2008 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 
 (NFPA 70) 

Revised 6.11.13 
 
 
100 Chapter 1 – General 
 
110.2 110.2 Approval.  Add to the end of the Section the following: 
 
 “All unused or abandoned electrical conduit, conductors, 

cables, fixtures, equipment, etc. shall be removed.” 
 
110.3(A)(1) 110.3(A)(1) Examination.  Revise as follows: 
 
 “(1) Suitability for installation and use in conformity with the 

provisions of this Code.  Suitability of equipment use may be 
identified by a description marked on or provided with a 
product to identify the suitability of the product for a 
specific purpose, environment or application.  Suitability of 
equipment may be evidenced by listing or labeling.  Such 
marks, listings or labeling shall be by Underwriters 
Laboratories (UL) or Canadian Standards Association 
(CSA) only.” 

 
110.3(C) Add new Article 110.3(C) as follows: 
 
 “Licensed Electrical Contractor.  All electrical installations, 

alterations, repairs or other work shall be performed by a 
licensed electrician or licensed electrical contractor.” 

 
 Exception: Electrical work performed on a single family 

dwelling unit by the homeowner if said unit is the primary 
residence of the homeowner.”  

 
 
200 Chapter 2 – Wiring and Protection 
 
210.52(G)(1) 210.52(G)(1) Basements and Garages.  Revise as follows: 
 
 “(1) At least one receptacle outlet, GFCI protected 

convenience outlet per parking space, and one ceiling 



receptacle per garage door,  in addition to those for specific 
equipment, shall be installed in each basement, in each 
attached garage, and in each detached garage with electrical 
power.  Additionally, at least one GFCI protected receptacle 
outlet shall be installed in each basement.” 

 
210.70(A)(4) Add new Article 210.70(A)(4) as follows: 
 
 “Closets.  All closets and storage areas with an area of 24.0 

square feet or larger, or a depth of 4 feet or larger, and 
which are not referenced in Article 210.70(A)(3), shall be 
equipped with a light fixture installed in accordance with 
Article 410.16.”  

 
230.43 230.43 Wiring Methods for 600 Volts Nominal, or Less.   
 

(1) Open wiring on insulators.  Delete in its entirety 
(2) Type IGS cable. Delete in its entirety 
(5) Electrical metallic tubing.  Delete in its entirety 
(6) Electrical nonmetallic tubing.  Delete in its entirety 
(7) Service-entrance conductors.  Delete in its entirety 
(8) Wireways.  Delete in its entirety 
(9) Busways.  ` Delete in its entirety 
(10) Auxilary gutters.  Delete in its entirety 
(12) Cablebus.  Delete in its entirety 
(13) Type MC cable.  Delete in its entirety 
(14) Mineral-insulated, metal-sheathed cable.  Delete in its 
entirety 
(15) Flexible metal conduit… Delete in its entirety 
(16) Liquidtight flexible nonmetallic conduit. Delete in its 
entirety 

 
230.70(A)(1) 230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location.  Revise as follows: 
 
 “The service disconnecting means shall be installed at a readily 

accessible location either outside of the building or structure or 
inside nearest within five feet of the point of entrance of the 
service conductors.”   

 
230.71(A) 230.71(A) General.  Delete in its entirety and in lieu of, add the 

following: 
 
 “General.  The service disconnecting means for each 

service permitted by 230.2, or for each set of service 
entrance conductors permitted by 230.40. Exception No.1, 
3, 4 or 5, shall consist of not more than one switch or 



circuit breaker.  Sequence switching of multiple 
disconnects is not permitted. 

 
 For the purpose of this section, disconnecting means 

installed as part of listed equipment and used solely for the 
following shall not be considered a service disconnecting 
means: 

 
 (1) Power monitoring equipment 
 
 (2) Surge-protective device(s) 
 
 (3) Control circuit of the ground-fault protection system 
 
 (4) Power-operable service disconnecting means” 
 
230.72(A) 230.72(A) General.  Delete in its entirety.  Only one service 

disconnecting means per service is permitted. 
 
230.96 Add new Article 230.96 as follows: 
 
 “Surge protection of equipment.  An approved surge 

protector, listed for the use, shall be installed at all new 
residential service panels.”   

 
240.4 240.4 Protection of Conductors.  Revise as follows: 
 
 “unless otherwise permitted or required in 240.4(A) through (H).  

In any case, it shall be unlawful for any person(s) to over 
fuse any conductor, motor or apparatus in excess of the 
maximum permitted by this code.” 

 
240.21 240.21 Location in Circuit.  Revise as follows: 
 
 “an overcurrent protective device meeting the requirements of 

240.4.  In any case, a single main breaker shall be installed 
in all electrical panels.” 

 
240.4(H) Add new Article 240.4(H) as follows: 
 
 “Renewable fuses.  Renewable fuses shall not be 

permitted.” 
 
240.87 Add new Article 240.87 as follows: 
 



 “Nonresidential Uses.  Circuit breakers on all 
nonresidential panelboards and switchboards shall be of 
the bolt-on type.” 

 
250.52(A)(1) 250.52(A)(1) Metal Underground Water Pipe.  Revise as 

follows: 
 
 “… the grounding electrode system.  Connection shall be 

made at the water meter and water heater locations, and the 
grounding electrode conductors shall be bonded to the 
street side of the water meter, and a properly sized bonding 
jumper placed across the water meter.” 

 
300 Chapter 3 – Wiring Methods and Materials 
 
310.2(B) 310.2(B) Conductor Material.  Revise as follows. 
 
 “Conductors in this article shall be of aluminum, copper-clad 

aluminum, or copper only unless otherwise specified. 
 
Table  Table 310.15(B)(6) Conductor Types and Sizes for 120/240- 
310.15(B)(6) Volt, 3-Wire, Single-Phase Dwelling Services and Feeders.  

Revise to add the following notes: 
 
 “Note 1.  For Single Family dwellings less than or equal to 

1,500 square feet, the required service rating shall be a 
minimum of 100 amperes.  The service entrance 
conductors shall consist of three # 3 THWN conductors in a 
minimum 1-1/4 inch conduit. 

 
 Note 2.  For Single-Family Dwellings between 1,501 and 

3,499 square feet, the required service rating shall be a 
minimum of 200 amperes.  The service entrance 
conductors shall consist of three # 3/0 THWN conductors in 
a minimum 2 inch conduit.  

 
Table  Table 314.16(A) Metal Boxes.  Revise to add the following note: 
314.16(A) 
 “Note 1.  boxes which are connected to a ¾ inch conduit 

shall have a minimum depth of 2-1/8 inches, and shall be  
4” x 4” or larger unless used for phone or data cables.” 

 
314.27(D) 314.27(D) Boxes at Ceiling-Suspended (Paddle) Fan Outlets.  

Revise as follows: 
 



 “… weight to be supported.  Any outlet box installed at or 
near the center of the ceiling of any bedroom, family room, 
den, study, dining room or similar room in a residential 
dwelling shall be listed for the support of a ceiling (paddle) 
fan.” 

 
320  320 Armored Cable: Type AC.  Delete in its entirety. 
 
330 330 Metal Clad Cable: Type MC.  Delete in its entirety. 
 
334  334 Nonmetallic-Sheathed Cable: Types NM, NMC and NMS.  

Delete in its entirety. 
 
338  338 Service-Entrance Cable: Types SE and USE.  Delete in its 

entirety. 
 
342.10(B) 342.10(B) Corrosion Environments.  Revise as follows: 
 
 “IMC, elbows, couplings and fittings shall be permitted to be 

installed in concrete, in direct contact with the earth, or in areas 
subject to severe corrosive influences where protected by 
corrosion protection and judged suitable for the condition.  
Intermediate metal conduit, elbows, couplings and fittings 
shall not be permitted to be installed in concrete.” 

 
352.10 352.10 Uses Permitted.   
 (A) Concealed.  PVC conduit shall… Delete in its entirety 
 (C) Cinders.  PVC conduit shall… Delete in its entirety 
 (E) Dry and Damp Locations.  PVC… Delete in its entirety 
 (F) Exposed.  PVC conduit shall… Delete in its entirety 
 (H) Support of Conduit Bodies.  PVC… Delete in its entirety 
 
358.12(3) 358.12(3) Uses Not Permitted.  Delete Condition 3 in its entirety 

and in lieu of, add the following: 
 
 “(3) In concrete.” 
 
362  362 Electrical Nonmetallic Tubing: Type ENT.  Delete in its 

entirety. 
 
382 382 Nonmetallic Extensions.  Delete in its entirety. 
 
388 388 Surface Nonmetallic Raceways.  Delete in its entirety. 
 
394  394 Concealed Knob-and-Tube Wiring.  Delete in its entirety. 
 



398  398 Open Wiring on Insulators.  Delete in its entirety. 
 
400 Chapter 4 – Equipment for General Use 
 
404.8(D) Add new Article 404.8(D) as follows: 
 
 “(D) Maximum Voltage.  Lighting or switching located less 

than 8 feet above the floor or working platform shall have a 
voltage of no greater than 150 volts to ground.” 

 
408.36 408.36 Overcurrent Protection.  Delete in its entirety and in lieu 

of, add the following:  
 
 “Overcurrent Protection.  All panelboards shall have a main 

breaker within the panelboard enclosure.  Allowances to 
the contrary within this code are hereby deleted.”   

 
410.16(A) 410.16(A) Luminaire Types Permitted.  Delete section in its 

entirety and in lieu of, add the following: 
 
 “Luminaire Types Permitted.  Listed luminaires of the 

following types shall be permitted to be installed in a 
closet: 

  
 (1) A recessed incandescent luminaire with a completely 

enclosed lamp 
 
 (2) A surface mounted or recessed fluorescent luminaire.   
 
 (3) A surface mounted or recessed L.E.D. luminaire.” 
 
700 Chapter 7 – Emergency Systems 
 
760.24  760.24 Mechanical Execution of Work.  Revise as follows: 
 

“… comply with 300.4(D).  Fire alarm cable which is 
permitted to run in free air shall be UL listed for such use 
and shall be red in color.” 



Bensenville Memo 
 
Date:  1.30.13 
 
To:   S. Viger 
 
From:   M. Rysavy 
 
RE:   2008 National Electric Code amendments 
 
 
As discussed previously, the amendments to the 2008 National Electric Code adopted in 
May of 2010 have been questioned from both internal and external customers over the 
past couple years.  These amendments were written by the former part time Electrical 
Inspector and have been accused of being overzealous and a bit too strict.  After careful 
review by the CED staff and our code consultants, TPI, we believe several revisions are 
warranted and will serve our community well in the coming years.  Please note that many 
of the amendments were deemed to be valid and should remain.  The following is a point 
by point explanation of modifications and deletions from our currently adopted 
amendments.  The existing amendment is listed in bold.  The reason for modification or 
deletion is listed in italics.  The attached revised amendments are the result of the 
justification listed below: 
 
110.26(D) Illumination.  Revise as follows: 
 “…motor control centers installed indoors.  For all nonresidential uses, such 

illumination shall be provided at all times, including such times where 
primary power is lost.  Additional lighting outlets…” 

This amendment should be deleted as it requires an unrealistic power supply for “all 
times.”  The standard 90 minute battery backup time is sufficient as listed in the code. 
 
210.52(G)(1) Basements and Garages.  Revise as follows: 
 “(1) At least one receptacle outlet, GFCI protected convenience outlet per 

parking space, located on separate walls and one ceiling receptacle per 
garage door,  in addition to those for specific equipment, shall be installed in 
each basement, in each attached garage, and in each detached garage with 
electrical power.  Additionally, at least one receptacle outlet shall be installed 
in each basement.” 

This amendment should be modified to remove the requirement for the garage 
convenience outlets to be on separate walls.  This simply adds cost for the homeowner 
and is unnecessary.  It also should include the requirement for the basement receptacle to 
be GFCI protected.  Previously this was not written into the amendment. 
 



Add new Article 210.70(A)(4) as follows: 
 “Closets.  All closets and storage areas with an area of 6.0 square feet or 

larger, and which are not referenced in Article 210.70(A)(3), shall be 
equipped with a fluorescent or recessed light fixture installed in accordance 
with Article 410.16.”  

Lighting in closets is one of our largest complaints from the residential residents and 
property managers.  Currently any closet that is 6 square feet or larger is required to 
have a light.  We feel this is far too low a number and it should be 24 square feet.  If a 
closet is 4 feet in depth or more, it should be required to have a light no matter the 
square footage because then it would be considered a walk-in.  With the current code, a 3 
feet wide pantry would be required to have a light, which is not necessary unless it is 
more than 4 feet deep, in which case it is a walk in pantry.   
 
Also part of this amendment is the restriction on fixture type.  Fixture types are regulated 
as part of code section 410.16(A), and thusly should be removed from this amendment to 
avoid redundancy. 
 
230.43 Wiring Methods for 600 Volts Nominal, or Less.  Delete in its entirety and in lieu 

of, add the following: 
 
 “Wiring Methods for 600 Volts, Nominal, or Less.  Service entrance 

conductors shall be installed in accordance with the applicable requirements 
of this Code covering the type of wiring method used, shall extend to the first 
means of disconnect inside the building, and shall be limited to rigid 
galvanized metal conduit or rigid aluminum metal conduit.” 

This amendment deals with types of conductors for electrical services.  The 2008 NEC 
allows for 16 different methods of installation.  The previous amendment only allowed 
two types of methods.  While many of the deleted conductors were done so with good 
reason, this modified amendment will allow the introduction of rigid nonmetallic 
conductors (most commonly PVC) as well.  PVC has proven to be a reliable and useful 
material in electric work, just as it has in plumbing installations, due to its high 
resistance to corrosive environments. 
 
Add new Article 230.96 as follows: 
 “Surge protection of equipment.  An approved surge protector, listed for the 

use, shall be installed at all new or altered residential service panels.”   
This amendment is a good amendment except in the case of altered panels.  A homeowner 
adding a single circuit to his panel would be required to upgrade the panel to include the 
surge protection system.  Staff’s opinion is this is too restrictive and should only be a 
requirement for new services as it can be added to a new panel easier and more 
economically than an existing panel. 
 



250.52(A)(1) Metal Underground Water Pipe.  Revise as follows: 
 “… the grounding electrode system.  Connection shall be made at the water 

meter location, and the grounding electrode conductors shall be bonded to 
the street side of the water meter, and a properly sized bonding jumper 
placed across the water meter.” 

This minor change is to include water heaters in the grounding and bonding process.  A 
ground or bond wire is required in the case of an equipment removal.  If the meter or 
water heater happen to be removed, the entire system will still be properly grounded. 
 
Add new Section 300.2(C) as follows: 
 “Permitted Raceways.  All new wiring installations shall be installed within 

Electrical Metallic Tubing or rigid conduit.”  
This is a redundant and partially incorrect code section and should be removed.  There 
are several more options for permitted raceways including flexible metallic conduit (limit 
6’ lengths) and PVC conduit. 
 
310.5 Minimum size of conductors.  Add Exception as follows: 
 “Exception:  All non-residential occupancies shall use minimum # 12 copper 

conductors for all current carrying conductors.” 
There is a table for allowable conductor sizes.  There is already an amendment 310.2(B) 
which restricts all conductors (wires) to copper.  This is a redundant amendment and 
should be removed. 
 
Table 310.15(B)(6) Conductor Types and Sizes for 120/240-Volt, 3-Wire, Single-Phase 

Dwelling Services and Feeders.  Revise to add the following notes: 
 “Note 1.  For Single Family dwellings less than or equal to 1,500 square feet, 

the required service rating shall be a minimum of 100 amperes, with a 
minimum 40 position panelboard.  The service entrance conductors shall 
consist of three # 3 THWN conductors in a minimum 1-1/4 inch conduit. 

 Note 2.  For Single-Family Dwellings between 1,501 and 3,499 square feet, the 
required service rating shall be a minimum of 200 amperes, with a minimum 42 
position panelboard.  The service entrance conductors shall consist of three # 
3/0 THWN conductors in a minimum 2 inch conduit. 

 Note 3.  For Single-Family Dwellings of 3,500 square feet or greater, the 
required service rating shall be a minimum of 400 amperes, with two 200 
ampere panels providing a minimum of 80 circuit positions.  The main service 
disconnect shall be a 4oo ampere circuit breaker located within the meter 
enclosure on the outside of the building.”   

Notes 1 and 2 include a minimum position size of each panel that must be custom 
ordered, or is largely unavailable.  These references should be deleted from the notes.  
Note 3 assumes a very large jump in electrical use for a 3,500 square feet house.  A  400 
amp service for any house should be backed up by calculations in accordance with 
section 220 and Annex D, not with a required standard that may oversize the service.  
Note 3 should be eliminated to avoid this requirement. 



314.22 Exposed Surface Extensions.  Delete in its entirety.  Extension boxes shall not be 
permitted. 
Extension boxes can be very helpful in remodel situations or retrofits and are required to 
be metallic.  This amendment should be deleted to allow their use. 
 
328 Medium Voltage Cable: Type MV.  Delete in its entirety. 
This amendment eliminated the ability to use medium voltage cable, which is most commonly 
used for wet location and direct bury locations.  This is a useful and safe conductor for many 
applications.  This amendment should be eliminated to allow its use. 
 
348 Flexible Metal Conduit:  Type FMC.  Delete in its entirety. 
This amendment eliminates the ability to use flexible metal conduit, which is most 
commonly used in equipment installations like lighting.  These short “whips” are limited 
to 6 feet in length and are used throughout the Village as this is a standard practice.  
This amendment should be eliminated to allow its use. 
 
352.10 Uses Permitted.  Delete in its entirety and in lieu of, add the following: 
 “Uses Permitted.  Rigid nonmetallic conduit shall be permitted for use 

underground on the outside of a building or structure, but shall not be 
installed within concrete.”  

The most common form of rigid nonmetallic conduit is PVC.  It is just as strong as a rigid 
metal conduit, which has no limitations on being installed in concrete or within a 
building.  This amendment should be eliminated to allow its use inside and outside a 
building.  This can be especially useful to our industrial building owners when running 
electrical under a building slab.  Rigid nonmetallic conduit can save thousands in 
underground electrical work throughout a building. 
 
Add new Article 406.8(B)(3) as follows: 
 “Receptacle covers.  Receptacles installed outdoors shall use covers that are 

sunlight resistant or metal.” 
This is a redundant amendment as the electric code already restricts the protective 
qualities of exterior receptacles.  It should be eliminated. 
 
Add new Article 408.31 as follows: 
 “Subpanels prohibited.  Subpanels are prohibited in residential installations 

unless specifically approved by the Building Official or Village Electrical 
Inspector. 

Subpanels are used frequently, most notably in detached garage locations.  Instead of 
running multiple conduits underground to the garage, one main conduit is used that can 
support a subpanel.  This can save time and money, yet carries no additional risk to the 
owner.  A subpanel shuts down from the main breaker panel just like a normal breaker 
would, so there is still a single point of disconnect for the property.  There is no reason to 
require special permission from the Village to allow a subpanel, which is why this 
amendment should be eliminated. 
 



Add new Article 408.36(E) as follows: 
 “Space for Future Use.  All panelboards shall be designed and installed so as 

to provide a minimum of 15% of spare circuit spaces for future use.” 
15% is an arbitrary number that doesn’t relate to any written code.  The load 
calculations for a project will determine what size service and how many circuits should 
be required.  This is commonly defended with the idea of “what about future growth 
within the property?”  Owners are encouraged to plan ahead for future growth, but it 
shouldn’t be required by the Village.  This amendment should be eliminated to avoid this 
unnecessary oversizing of services and panel sizes. 
 
422.16(B)(1) 422.16(B)(1) Electrically Operated Kitchen Waste Disposers.  Delete in 
its entirety.  Flexible cord connections shall not be permitted for the connection of 
electrically operated kitchen waste disposers. 
422.16(B)(2) 422.16(B)(2) Built-in Dishwashers and Trash Compactors.  Revise as 
follows.  Flexible cord connections shall not be permitted for the connection of built-
in dishwashers. 
 “Built-in dishwashers and trash compactors shall be permitted…”  
Both of these amendments deal with cord type connections for small kitchen appliances.  
While flexible metal conduit is allowed, a UL listed and approved cord is not under the 
current amendment.  With all the new in counter vacuum switching systems on the 
market, these two amendments should be eliminated to keep up with the changing 
technology.   
 
Add new Article 440.9 as follows:  
 “Conductors or Wireways.  Conductors or wireways which serve rooftop 

HVAC units shall not be permitted to run through the unit.” 
The code does not allow for mechanical units to serve as a raceway already.  This is a 
redundant amendment and should be eliminated. 
 
604  Manufactured Wiring Systems.  Delete in its entirety. 
605 Office Furnishing (Consisting of Lighting Accessories and Wired Partitions)  

Delete Article in its entirety and in lieu of, add the following: 
 “Office Furnishing (Consisting of Lighting Accessories and Wired Partitions) 

All office furnishings shall be hard wired and served by approved junction 
boxes.  Junction boxes shall not be hidden or enclosed within the partitions 
or other portions of the office furnishings, but shall remain open so as to 
permit inspection.  A minimum of three duplex receptacles shall be provided 
for each cubicle.” 

Amendments to these two sections eliminated the use of manufactured wiring systems and 
office furnishings.  Most impacted by these exclusions is the installation of office 
cubicles.  Our code would require the installer to remove all the UL listed wiring within 
the prefabrication system and then surface mount metal conduit and junction boxes with 
receptacles onto the outside of the partitions, which nullifies the purpose of a cubicle 
system.  As long as a system is UL listed as the code requires, it should be allowed to be 
installed.  These two amendments should be eliminated. 



Add new Article 700.8(C) as follows: 
 “(C) Construction of exit signs.  All exit signs shall be constructed as follows: 

(1) All exit signs shall be LED fixtures constructed with a metallic 
casing and plastic lens or equal.  (Examples include Cooper 
SLX 70RWH and Astra Lite, Model 3200.)  This requirement 
shall apply in all installations including those with emergency 
generator power. 

(2) All exit signs shall be equipped with back-up emergency power 
capable of maintaining not less than 87.5% of normal 
operating voltage for a period of not less than 2 hours” 

700.12(F) Unit equipment.  Revise as follows: 
 “the batteries shall be of suitable rating and capacity to supply and maintain at not 

less than 87.5 percent of the nominal battery voltage for the total lamp load 
associated with the unit for a period of at least 1.5 hours 2 hours, or the 
equipment shall supply and maintain not less than 60 percent of the initial 
emergency illumination for a period of at least 1.5 hours 2 hours.  Storage 
batteries, whether of the acid or alkali type, shall be designed and constructed to 
meet the requirements of emergency service.  Additionally, the emergency light 
unit shall be constructed of metal casings and glass lenses.” 

Historically the Village of Bensenville used the Chicago Electric Code to influence the 
emergency lighting and exit sign requirements.  This amendment causes one of the 
biggest points of contention with our nonresidential building owners and our codes.  The 
two hour batteries are hard to find and are generally special order items, if they are 
available at all.  The metal housings are more expensive and lack architectural appeal.  
None of our neighboring communities (Franklin Park, Elmhurst, Addison, Wooddale, 
Itasca, and Elk Grove) require these upgraded emergency and exit lights.  The 2008 NEC 
allows for plastic housings with 90 minute batteries that can be purchased at any 
electrical supply house or big box store.  These two amendments should be eliminated. 
 
760.24 Mechanical Execution of Work.  Revise as follows: 
 “… comply with 300.4(D).  Fire alarm cable installed within non-accessible, 

concealed locations, such as in walls, floors and hard ceilings shall be 
installed within an approved raceway, which is red in color.  Cable which is 
permitted to run in free air shall be UL listed for such use and shall be red in 
color.” 

This amendment should be partially eliminated to simplify construction methods.  While 
it is important to denote fire alarm cables from standard network cables with the red 
color, the need for concealed conduit to be red as well is unnecessary.  If the conduit is 
concealed, it is not visible. 
 
760.30 Fire Alarm Circuit Identification.  Revise as follows: 
 “… during testing and servicing of other systems.  Raceways used to enclose fire 

alarm cable shall be red in color.  Fire alarm cable not enclosed in conduit, 
tubing or wireways shall be approved for that purpose and shall be red in 
color.” 

This is a redundant amendment to 760.24 and should be eliminated.   



TYPE:    Ordinance                SUBMITTED BY:             S. Viger              DATE: 06.05.13 
 
DESCRIPTION: Ordinance approving a Conditional Use Permit Amendment to Ordinance #83 - 
2012 for Sirius XM to allow the installation of an additional antenna above 35’ located at 602 N. 
York Road in an existing C – 4 Regional Destination PUD Commercial District. 
 

SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 
 Financially Sound Village  Enrich the lives of Residents 
 Quality Customer Oriented Services X Major Business/Corporate Center 
 Safe and Beautiful Village X Vibrant Major Corridors 
 
COMMITTEE ACTION: Commercial and Economic Development 
 Approved (6 – 0)  DATE: 05.21.13 

 
BACKGROUND: The property in question, 602 N. York Road, is zoned C – 4 Regional Destination 
PUD Commercial and is currently improved with a one-story brick building and an existing 127’ 
telecommunications tower on the northeast portion of the site. The construction of the 
telecommunications tower was granted in 1982 as a Conditional Use Permit in Ordinance #19-
82. In 2007 and again in 2012 the tower was updated with the addition of antennas. To execute 
the proposed construction, the applicant, American Tower Corporation, seeks a Conditional 
Use Permit Amendment to allow the collocation of equipment including a single panel antenna 
and one dish antenna and in addition to an equipment cabinet within the existing fenced 
area. 
 
KEY ISSUES: The staff believes that the request for a Conditional Use Permit Amendment meets 
all the Approval Criteria for Conditional Use Permits. There will not be an increase in traffic 
volume as it is an unmanned facility, the use will not have negative effects of noise, glare, odor, 
dust or other adverse environmental effects, it will not affect neighborhood character as the 
telecommunications tower is existing and the addition of the antennas will eliminate the need 
to construct another tower, the use of public facilities will not increase disproportionately, and 
the proposed installation is a public necessity. 
 
ALTERNATIVES:  
1. Discretion of the Board. 
2. Deny the Conditional Use Permit amendment request. 
3. Remand the request back to the Community Development Commission. 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  Staff respectfully recommends approval of the Conditional Use Permit 
Amendment and with conditions: 
1. The Conditional Use Permit be granted solely to the applicant; 
2 The property shall be developed and utilized in substantial conformance to the plans 

submitted as part of this application prepared by Fullerton Engineering Design dated 
03.25.13 last revised 04.01.13 

 
At the 05.13.13 Public Hearing the Community Development Commission voted unanimously (7 
- 0) to recommend approval of the Conditional Use Permit Amendment with the conditions 
recommended by staff. There was no public comment at the Hearing. 
 
At their 05.21.13 meeting the CEDC approved unanimously (6 – 0) the CUP amendment. 
 
BUDGET IMPACT:  N/A 
 
ACTION REQUIRED: Approval of the attached CUP Amendment Ordinance.  



CDC#2013 – 12 602 North York Road 

Sirius XM 

Conditional Use Permit Amendment 

 

 



ORDINANCE NO.  ________________ 
 

AN ORDINANCE CONCERNING THE GRANT OF A SECOND AMENDMENT  
TO AN EXISTING CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT  

TO ALLOW ADDITIONAL ANTENNAE ON A CELL TOWER AT 
602 N. YORK ROAD, BENSENVILLE, ILLINOIS 

 
 WHEREAS, Lisa Kahn (“Owner”) and American Tower and Sirius XM (collectively 

“Applicant”), filed an application seeking a second amendment to an existing conditional use 

permit, allowed pursuant to Ordinance No. 65-2007, and previously amended pursuant to Ordinance 

No. 83-2012,   to allow additional antennae to be placed in and on a cell tower site in C-4 Regional 

Destination PUD Commercial  District pursuant to Section 10-15-2C of The Village of Bensenville 

Zoning Ordinance (“Zoning Ordinance”) at property commonly known as 602 N. York Road, 

Bensenville, as legally described in Exhibit "A," attached hereto and incorporated herein by 

reference (the “Subject Property”),  a copy of said application being on file in the Community and 

Economic Development Department; and 

 WHEREAS, the Subject Property is currently improved with a one-story brick building and 

a telecommunications antenna which has an overall structural height of 127 feet on the northeast 

portion of the site, which was approved by the Village Board, pursuant to Ordinance No. 83-2012; 

and 

 WHEREAS, the Applicant seeks a conditional use permit to allow the colocation of 

equipment including items requiring a conditional use permit, specifically, an antenna mounted at 

eighty-eight (80) feet, and the addition of a new 10 x 10 foot equipment pad within the existing 

fenced area of the Subject Property; and 

 WHEREAS, Notice of Public Hearing with respect to the amendment of the conditional use 

permit sought by the Owner/Applicant was published in the Daily Herald on April 27, 2013 in the 

Village of Bensenville, and notice was also given via posting of a Public Hearing Sign on the 

property and via personal mail, all as required by the statutes of the State of Illinois and the 

ordinances of the Village; and 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to said Notice, the Community Development Commission of the 

Village of Bensenville conducted a Public Hearing commencing on May 12, 2013 as required by 

the statutes of the State of Illinois and the ordinances of the Village, and after hearing the 

application, made the findings of facts submitted by staff recommending approval of the 



application, which findings are attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference as Exhibit “B;” 

and 

 WHEREAS, upon said findings of facts, the Community Development Commission 

voted unanimously to grant the application for amendment of the conditional use permit to a 

colocation of equipment including those requiring a conditional use permit, specifically, an 

antenna mounted at eighty-eight (80) feet and the addition to a new 10 x 10 foot equipment pad 

within the existing fenced area of the Subject Property; and 

 WHEREAS, the Community Development Commission forwarded its recommendation  to 

approve  the application to the Village Board’s Community and Economic Development Committee 

which concurred in the recommendation to grant the application; and  

 WHEREAS, the Community and Economic Development Committee then forwarded its 

recommendation, along with that of the Community Development Commission, to the President and 

Board of Trustees on June 11, 2013; and 

WHEREAS, the President and Board of Village Trustees considered the matter and 

determined, based on its consideration, that the permit should be granted, finding that it is 

consistent with the Zoning Ordinance and the orderly and harmonious development of the 

Village.  

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the 

Village of Bensenville, Counties of DuPage and Cook, Illinois, duly assembled at a regular 

meeting, as follows: 

 SECTION ONE:  That the forgoing recitals are hereby incorporated by reference as if 

fully set forth herein. 

 SECTION TWO: That the application for an amendment of an existing conditional 

use permit to allow the Owner/Applicant to have the colocation of equipment including an 

antenna mounted at eighty-eight (80) feet (in conjunction with those items not requiring a 

conditional use permit) and an additional 10 x 10 foot equipment pad within the existing fenced 

area of the Subject Property is hereby granted, subject to the following conditions:  (1) the 

Conditional Use Permit be granted solely to American Towers, Inc. and shall be transferred only 

after a review by the Community Development Commission (CDC) and approval of the Village 

Board. In the event of the sale or lease of this property, the proprietors shall appear before a 

public meeting of the CDC. The CDC shall review the request and in its sole discretion, shall 



either; recommend that the Village Board approve of the transfer of the lease and / or ownership 

to the new proprietor without amendment to the Conditional Use Permit, or if the CDC deems 

that the new proprietor contemplates a change in use which is inconsistent with the Conditional 

Use Permit, the new proprietor shall be required to petition for a new public hearing before the 

CDC for a new Conditional Use Permit; (2) the property shall be developed and utilized in 

substantial compliance to the plans to be submitted as a part of this application on prepared by 

Fullerton Engineering Design dated 03.25.13 last revised 04.01.13, and (3) all conditions 

contained in Ordinance Nos. 65-2007 and 83-2012, except as varied herein. 

SECTION THREE:  That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after 

its passage, approval, and publication in pamphlet form as provided by law. 

PASSED AND APPROVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of 

Bensenville, this 11th day of June, 2013. 

     ____________________________________ 
      Frank Soto, Village President 

 
ATTEST: 
________________________________ 
Ilsa Rivera-Trujillo, Village Clerk 
 
AYES:________________________________________________________________ 
 
NAYES:_______________________________________________________________ 
 
ABSENT:______________________________________________________________ 
 
f:\pkb\bensenville\ordinances\zoning\conditionaluse\602york.celltower.doc 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Ordinance # ___- 2013 
Exhibit “A” 
 
The Legal Description of the property is as follows: 
 
THAT PART OF LOT 2 IN KLEFSTAD’S BENSENVILLE INDUSTRIAL PARK, BEING A 
SUBDIVISION IN SECTION 2 AND 11, TOWNSHIP 40 NORTH, RANGE 11, EAST OF THE 
THIRD PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED 
JANUARY 20, 1967 AS DOCUMENT R67-2065, LYING EASTERLY OF A LINE DRAWN 
FROM A POINT IN THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID LOT 2 WHICH IS 185.0 FEET WEST OF THE 
NORTHEAST CORNER OF SAID LOT, (EXCEPTING THEREFROM THAT PART THEREOF 
DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS: COMMENCING AT THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF SAID 
LOT 2; THENCE SOUTH 00 DEGRESS 40 MINUTES 53 SECONDS WEST ALONG THE 
WEST RIGHT OF WAY LINE OF YORK ROAD AS PER DOCUMENT 470562 A DISTANCE 
OF 162.34 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE SOUTH 03 DEGREES 32 
MINUTES 50 SECONDS WEST A DISTANCE OF 100.0 FEET TO A POINT5.0 FEET WEST 
OF SAID RIGHT OF WAY LINE; THENCE SOUTH 00 DEGREES 40 MINUTES 53 
SECONDS WEST ALONG A LINE 5.0 FEET WEST AND PARALLEL WITH SAID WEST 
RIGHT OF WAY LINE A DISTANCE OF 41.25 FEET TO A POINT ON THE NORTH RIGHT 
OF WAY LINE OF FOSTER AVENUE; THENCE NORTH 89 DEGREES 41 MINUTES 32 
SECONDS EAST ALONG SAID NORTH RIGHT OF WAY LINE 36.93 FEET TO THE 
SOUTHEAST CORNER OF SAID LOT 2; THENCE NORTH 00 DEGREES 40 MINUTES 53 
SECONDS EAST ALONG SAID WEST RIGHT  OF WAY LINE A DISTANCE OF 161.71 
FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING), DUPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS. 
 
Commonly known as 602 N. York Road Bensenville, Illinois. 
Permanent Index Number: 03 – 11 – 202 – 048 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Ordinance # ___- 2013 
Exhibit “B” 
Findings of Fact 
Motion:  Commissioner Weldon made a motion to approve the findings of fact for 

the conditional use request consisting of:  

1. Traffic: The proposed use will not create any adverse impact of types 
or volumes of traffic flow not otherwise typical of permitted uses in 
the zoning district has been minimized. No increase in traffic volume 
is expected as the subject property is an unmanned facility and only 
sporadic maintenance would need to be performed during the course of 
operation.  

2. Environmental Nuisance: The proposed use will not have negative 
effects of noise, glare, odor, dust, waste disposal, blockage of light or 
air or other adverse environmental effects of a type or degree not 
characteristic of the historic use of the property or permitted uses in 
the district. As this is a proposed collocation of equipment onto an 
existing wireless communications tower, it prevents the need for an 
additional tower to be built. The site itself produces no waste, dust, 
glare, odor and only minimal sound from an internal cooling source. 

3. Neighborhood Character: The proposed use will fit harmoniously 
with the existing character of existing permitted uses in its environs. 
Any adverse effects on environmental quality, property values or 
neighborhood character beyond those normally associated with 
permitted uses in the district have been minimized. The proposed 
installation involves additional equipment being added onto an 
existing wireless communications tower as well as utilizing available 
space within the existing compound for an additional radio equipment 
cabinet.  The installation conforms to the current use and will not 
change the current character of the area. 

4. Use Of Public Services And Facilities: The proposed use will not 
require existing community facilities or services to a degree 
disproportionate to that normally expected of permitted uses in the 
district, nor generate disproportionate demand for new services or 
facilities in such a way as to place undue burdens upon existing 
development in the area. As an unmanned facility there will be no 
unusual demands placed upon the municipal services or facilities. 

5. Public Necessity: The proposed use at the particular location 
requested is necessary to provide a service or a facility which is in the 
interest of public convenience, and will contribute to the general 
welfare of the neighborhood or community. There is an expanding use 
and need for satellite services in and around Bensenville. Expanded facilities 
such as this service that need. 

 



6. Other Factors: The use is in harmony with any other elements of 
compatibility pertinent in the judgment of the commission to the 
conditional use in its proposed location. Other factors are subject to the 
Commission’s judgment.  

Commissioner Rowe seconded the motion. 

Roll Call: Ayes: Moruzzi, Caira, Janowiak, Pisano, Rodriguez, Rowe, Weldon 
  

Nays: None 
  

All were in favor. Motion carried. 
 



1 
 

 
STAFF REPORT 
 
 
HEARING DATE:    May 13, 2013 
CASE #:    2013 - 12 
PROPERTY:    602 North York Road 
PROPERTY OWNER: American Tower 
APPLICANT: Sirius XM 
BUILDING SIZE:   N/A 
SITE ACREAGE:     2891 Square Feet (Leased Area) 
PIN NUMBERS:   03 – 11 – 202 – 048  
REQUEST:   Amendment to a previously approved 

Conditional Use Permit (CUP) to allow 
additional antennas and ground cabinets 
to an existing cellular tower 
Municipal Code Section 10 – 15– 2C 

PUBLIC NOTICE: 
1. A Legal Notice was published in the Daily Herald on Saturday April 

27, 2013. A Certified copy of the Legal Notice is maintained in the 
CDC file and is available for viewing and inspection at the 
Community & Economic Development department during regular 
business hours. 

2. Village personnel posted a Notice of Public Hearing sign on the 
property, visible from the public way on Friday April 26, 2013. 

3. On Thursday April 25, 2013 Village personnel mailed from the 
Bensenville Post Office via First Class Mail a Notice of Public Hearing 
to taxpayers of record within 250’ of the property in question. An 
Affidavit of Mailing executed by C & ED personnel and the list of 
recipients are maintained in the CDC file and are available for 
viewing and inspection at the Community & Economic 
Development department during regular business hours. 

 
 



2 
 

REVISED SUMMARY: 
The property in question is zoned C – 4 Regional Destination PUD 
Commercial. The 600 – 602 property is improved with a one-story brick 
building and an existing 127’ telecommunications tower on the northeast 
portion of the site. The applicant seeks a collocation of equipment 
including one additional dish antenna at 20’and one panel at 88’. An 
additional equipment cabinet as well as other equipment is proposed at 
ground level within the leased and fenced area. 
 
SURROUNDING LAND USE:  

 Zoning Land Use Comprehensive Plan Jurisdiction 

Site C – 4 Communications 
Tower 

Special Planning  Area; 
General Commercial 

Village of 
Bensenville 

North C – 4 Vacant Special Planning  Area; 
General Commercial 

Village of 
Bensenville 

South C – 4 Vacant Special Planning  Area; 
General Commercial 

Village of 
Bensenville 

East Planned 
Development O’Hare Airport N/A City of  

Chicago 

West C - 4 Warehouse Special Planning  Area; 
General Commercial 

Village of 
Bensenville 

  
 
DEPARTMENT COMMENTS: 
SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 

 Financially Sound Village 
 Quality Customer Oriented Services 
 Safe and Beautiful Village 
 Enrich the lives of Residents 

X Major Business/Corporate Center 
 Vibrant Major Corridors 

 
Finance:  No comment. 
Police:  

1. After reviewing the petition, I do not see any impacts to 
public safety nor police services from the granting of the 
petition 

Engineering:   
1. No comments. 

Public Works:  
1.  No comments. 



3 
 

 
Community & Economic Development: 

Economic Development 
1. Co – locating at a single site is preferable to separate sites. 

 
Code Compliance  
1. General Review Criteria  

1.  
B

      
1. A

 
f
u
l
l
 
b
u 

2. No Fire related issues. 
Building: 

1. Building permit review will be completed upon 
approval of the Village Board. 

Community Development 
1. The property in question falls within the C – 4 Regional 

Destination PUD Commercial District. 
2. The telecommunications tower in question is erected 

adjacent to the northwest corner of the existing 600 N. 
York Road building. 

3. A Conditional Use Permit was granted by the Village to 
MCI Telecommunications in Ordinance #19-82 on June 3, 
1982 for the construction of a telecommunications relay 
tower not to exceed the height of 125’. 

4. American Tower Corporation purchased the tower in 1998. 
5. In 2007, a Conditional Use Permit was granted for 

American Tower Corporation in Ordinance #65-2007 to 
add twelve (12) antennae and one equipment shelter to 
an existing telecommunications tower and site, 
respectively.  

6. More recently the Village approved ordinance #83 – 2012 
(copy attached)an amendment to  the 2007 Ordinance 
to include the installation of an antenna at the top of the 
125’ tower bringing the overall structural height to 127’as it 
exceeds the maximum permitted mounting height of 35’. 

Requirements met for: Yes No N/A Comments 
Fire Alarm System   X  
Sprinkler System   X  
Hydrant Placement X    
Change of Use   X  
Fire Lanes X    
Key Box X    
Hazardous Chemicals   X  
Walk Through Inspection 
completed 

 X   

Other   X  



4 
 

7. Staff does not object to the additional antennas at this 
location. 

 

 
APPROVAL CRITERIA FOR CONDITIONAL USES:  
The Community Development Commission shall not recommend approval 
of the Conditional Use Permit without determining that the request meets 
the following approval criteria and making certain findings of fact.  Staff 
has reviewed the request and recommends the following Findings of Fact:   

1. Traffic: The proposed use will not create any adverse impact of types or 
volumes of traffic flow not otherwise typical of permitted uses in the zoning 
district has been minimized. 

No increase in traffic volume is expected as the subject property is an 
unmanned facility and only sporadic maintenance would need to be 
performed during the course of operation.  

2. Environmental Nuisance: The proposed use will not have negative effects 
of noise, glare, odor, dust, waste disposal, blockage of light or air or other 
adverse environmental effects of a type or degree not characteristic of 
the historic use of the property or permitted uses in the district.  

As this is a proposed collocation of equipment onto an existing wireless 
communications tower, it prevents the need for an additional tower to be 
built. The site itself produces no waste, dust, glare, odor and only minimal 
sound from an internal cooling source. 

3. Neighborhood Character: The proposed use will fit harmoniously with the 
existing character of existing permitted uses in its environs. Any adverse 
effects on environmental quality, property values or neighborhood 
character beyond those normally associated with permitted uses in the 
district have been minimized. 

The proposed installation involves additional equipment being added 
onto an existing wireless communications tower as well as utilizing 
available space within the existing compound for an additional radio 
equipment cabinet.  The installation conforms to the current use and will 
not change the current character of the area. 

The review and recommendation of the Conditional Use Permit should 
be determined by the “Approval Criteria” found in the Village’s Zoning 
Ordinance.  



5 
 

4. Use Of Public Services And Facilities: The proposed use will not require 
existing community facilities or services to a degree disproportionate to 
that normally expected of permitted uses in the district, nor generate 
disproportionate demand for new services or facilities in such a way as to 
place undue burdens upon existing development in the area. 

As an unmanned facility there will be no unusual demands placed upon 
the municipal services or facilities. 

5. Public Necessity: The proposed use at the particular location requested is 
necessary to provide a service or a facility which is in the interest of public 
convenience, and will contribute to the general welfare of the 
neighborhood or community. 

There is an expanding use and need for satellite services in and around 
Bensenville. Expanded facilities such as this service that need. 

6. Other Factors: The use is in harmony with any other elements of 
compatibility pertinent in the judgment of the commission to the 
conditional use in its proposed location. 

Other factors are subject to the Commission’s judgment.  

 

 Meets  Criteria 
Conditional Use Approval Criteria Yes No 
1. Traffic X  
2. Environmental Nuisance X  
3. Neighborhood Character X  
4. Public Services and Facilities X  
5. Public Necessity X  
6. Other Factors X  

 
Staff finds all Approval Criteria have been met. 

RECOMMENDATIONS: 

Staff recommends the approval of the above Findings of Fact and the 
Conditional Use Permit Amendment subject to the following conditions: 
 

1. The Conditional Use Permit Amendment be 
granted solely to American Towers, Inc. and shall 
be transferred only after a review by the 



6 
 

Community Development Commission (CDC) 
and approval of the Village Board. In the event 
of the sale or lease of this property, the 
proprietors shall appear before a public meeting 
of the CDC. The CDC shall review the request 
and in its sole discretion, shall either; recommend 
that the Village Board approve of the transfer of 
the lease and / or ownership to the new 
proprietor without amendment to the 
Conditional Use Permit, or if the CDC deems that 
the new proprietor contemplates a change in 
use which is inconsistent with the Conditional Use 
Permit, the new proprietor shall be required to 
petition for a new public hearing before the CDC 
for a new Conditional Use Permit.  

 
2. The property shall be developed and utilized in 

substantial conformance to the plans submitted 
as part of this application prepared by Fullerton 
Engineering Design dated 03.25.13 last revised 
04.01.13 

Respectfully Submitted, 
Department of Community  
& Economic Development 
 



  
 

 

12 South Center Street 
Bensenville, IL 60106 
 
Office: 630.766.8200 
Fax: 630.350.3434 
www.bensenville.il.us  
 

 

VILLAGE BOARD 
 
President 
Frank Soto 
 
Trustees 
Morris Bartlett 
Susan V. Janowiak 
Robert “Bob” Jarecki 
Martin O’Connell 
JoEllen Ridder 
Henry Wesseler 
 
Village Clerk 
Ilsa Rivera- Trujillo 
 
Village Manager 
Michael J. Cassady 

VILLAGE BOARD 
 INFRASTRUCTURE AND ENVIRONMENT  

COMMITTEE MEETING 
AGENDA  

 6:45 P.M. – Or Immediately Following The Community & 
Economic Development Committee Meeting 

Tuesday, June 11, 2013 
Bensenville Village Hall, 12 S. Center Street, Bensenville IL  60106 

  
Call to Order 
Roll Call 
Approval of Minutes:   May 21, 2013 
        
ACTION ITEMS 

 
1. Consideration of a Resolution to Approve the Contract Terms Amending the 

Residential Solid Waste, Yard Waste and Recycling Services Agreement with 
Republic Services (F/K/A Allied Waste) 

2. As Submitted 

INFORMATIONAL ITEMS 

Adjournment 

 
 
 
 
 



Village of Bensenville
Village Board Room

12 South Center Street
Bensenville, Illinois 60106

Counties of DuPage and Cook

MINUTES OF THE INFRASTRUCTURE AND ENVIRONMENT COMMITTEE
May 21, 2013

CALL TO ORDER: Chairman Wesseler called the meeting to order at 6:38 p.m.

PRESENT: Upon roll call by Deputy Village Clerk, Corey Williamsen, the
following Board Members were present:

Chairman Wesseler, President Soto, Bartlett, Jarecki,
O’Connell, Ridder

Absent: Janowiak

A quorum was present.

Village Clerk, Ilsa Rivera-Trujillo was also in attendance.

Staff Present: Caracci, Cassady, DiSanto, Kosman, Rysavy,
Sloth, Williamsen

Approval of
Minutes: The April 16, 2013 Infrastructure and Environment

Committee Meeting minutes were presented.

Motion: President Soto made a motion to approve the minutes as
presented. Trustee O’Connell seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.



Minutes of the Infrastructure and Environment Committee Meeting
May 21, 2013 Page 2

IPWMAN: Director of Public Works, Joe Caracci, presented to the
Committee an ordinance authorizing the execution of the
Illinois Public Works Mutual Aid Network Agreement
(IPWMAN).

There were no questions from the Committee.

Motion: President Soto made a motion to approve this item for
placement on a future Village Board Meeting Agenda for
action. Trustee Bartlett seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Engineering
Enterprises: Director of Public Works, Joe Caracci, presented to the

Committee a resolution authorizing the execution of an
engineering service agreement with Engineering
Enterprises, Inc. for the Wood Avenue Watermain and Street
Improvement Project (Volk Brothers Phase III) in the amount
of $115,681.

There were no questions from the Committee.

Motion: Chairman Wesseler made a motion to approve this item for
placement on a future Village Board Meeting Agenda for
action. Trustee Jarecki seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Title 9,
Chapter 14: Director of Public Works, Joe Caracci, presented to the

Committee an ordinance adopting a revised DuPage County
Stormwater Management Ordinance and Amending Title 9,
Chapter 14, Section 1 of the Bensenville Village Code.

There were no questions from the Committee.

Motion: Trustee Bartlett made a motion to approve this item for
placement on a future Village Board Meeting Agenda for
action. Trustee Ridder seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.



Minutes of the Infrastructure and Environment Committee Meeting
May 21, 2013 Page 3

Motor Fuel Tax
Fund Audit: Director of Public Works, Joe Caracci, presented to the

Committee three resolutions regarding supplemental
appropriations resulting in the Illinois Department of
Transportation’s Motor Fuel Tax Fund Audit:

A: Resolution appropriating additional funds in the amount of
$727,376.68 for improvements completed as part of the
section #00-00081-00-PK to resolve the discrepancy
discovered during the audit of the Village’s Motor Fuel Tax
(MFT) funds.

B. Resolution appropriating additional funds in the amount of
$131,034.89 for improvements completed as part of the
section #96-00077-00-FP to resolve the discrepancy
discovered during the audit of the Village’s Motor Fuel Tax
(MFT) funds.

C. Resolution appropriating additional funds in the amount of
$779,593.86 for improvements completed as part of the
section #97-00078-00-FP to resolve the discrepancy
discovered during the audit of the Village’s Motor Fuel Tax
(MFT) funds.

There were no questions from the Committee.

Motion: President Soto made a motion to approve this item for
placement on a future Village Board Meeting Agenda for
action. Trustee Ridder seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

AS SUBMITTED: Chairman Wesseler asked for an update regarding the
School District No. 2 flood relief project. Mr. Caracci
provided an update to the Committee.

Chairman Wesseler asked if banners along Irving Park Road
will be larger. Mr. Caracci stated the next set of banners will
be larger along Irving Park Road.



Minutes of the Infrastructure and Environment Committee Meeting
May 21, 2013 Page 4

INFORMATIONAL
ITEMS:

Quite Zones: Mr. Caracci provided the Committee with an update
regarding the wayside horn testing. Mr. Caracci stated there
was no negative comments from Residents who participated
in the test. Mr. Caracci stated the horn will sound for the
duration of the train at the railroad tracks at York Road.

Mr. Cassady asked for a motion allowing Staff to proceed
with a letter of intent for the wayside horn at the railroad
crossing at York Road.

Motion: President Soto made a motion to allow Staff to proceed with
a letter of intent for a wayside horn at the York Road railroad
crossing. Chairman Wesseler seconded the motion.

All were in favor, motion carried.

Residential Waste
Contract: Mr. Cassady provided the Committee with an update

regarding the Village’s current waste contract with Allied
Waste. Mr. Cassady stated Allied Waste’s contract is set to
expire and the company is seeking an extension with the
Village. Mr. Cassady asked for permission to allow Staff to
begin negotiations with Allied Waste regarding an potential
contract extension.

Motion: Trustee Ridder made a motion to allow Staff to begin
negotiations with Allied Waste for a potential contract
extension. Trustee Jarecki seconded the motion.

All were in favor, motion carried.

ADJOURNMENT: Trustee Bartlett made a motion to adjourn the meeting.
Trustee Ridder seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Chairman Wesseler adjourned the meeting at 7:28 p.m.
Corey Williamsen
Deputy Village Clerk
PASSED AND APPROVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Bensenville this day, June, 2013



TYPE:  Resolution  SUBMITTED BY: Dan Di Santo  DATE: June 11, 2013 
 
DESCRIPTION:   Approve the Contract Terms Amending the Residential Solid Waste, Yard Waste 
and Recycling Services Agreement with Republic Services (F/K/A Allied Waste) 
 

SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 
X Financially Sound Village X Enrich the lives of Residents 
X Quality Customer Oriented Services  Major Business/Corporate Center 
X Safe and Beautiful Village  Vibrant Major Corridors 
 
COMMITTEE ACTION: I&E – Authorized Staff to Negotiate 
w/ Allied Waste on a Contract Extension DATE:  May 21, 2013 
 
BACKGROUND: The Village of Bensenville first contracted with Republic Services (F/K/A BFI and 
Allied Waste) for Residential Solid Waste, Yard Waste, and Recycling Services on October 2, 2001.  
The Agreement was last extended in 2009 and expires on September 30, 2013.  At the May 21, 2013 
meeting, the I&E Committee unanimously voted (6-0) to allow staff the discretion to negotiate a 
contract extension with Republic Services in lieu of issuing a Request for Proposal (RFP). 
 
KEY ISSUES: Since the May 21 meeting, staff has met with Republic Services and has come to an 
agreement on contract terms (attached) that address all of the Village’s goals in negotiation. 
 

Monthly Rate Term 
*Proposed New Contract 

Amount Charged to 
Village per Contract 

Amount Paid 
by Residents 

Amount Paid by 
Seniors 

May 1, 2011 – April 30, 2012 $22.40 $22.58 $22.58 
May 1, 2012 – April 30, 2013 $23.47 $22.58 $22.58 

May 1, 2013 – September 30, 2013 $24.58 $22.58 $22.58 
October 1, 2013 – December 31, 2014* $22.58 $22.58 $19.19 
January 1, 2015 – December 31, 2018* Increased annually by CPI-Transportation Index 
 
These proposed rates represent an 8.1% reduction for single-family residential units and a 21.9% rate 
reduction for seniors.  When multi-family units are included, the new contract represents a 10.4% rate 
reduction across the board.  Other key components of the proposed contract include: 

· All residents receive a 65-gallon recycling cart, paid for by Republic, and can upgrade to a 95-
gallon for no additional fee (see attached single-family rate comparison); 

· Multi-family buildings with trash compactors (Linden Tower and Yorkbrook Apartments) will 
receive a 15.5% discount off their current rate (8% discount in future years); 

· All other multi-family buildings will receive a 2.5% rate discount (see attached rate comparison); 
· Republic will assume billing of all multi-family customers at no additional charge; 
· The contract term will be for 63 months, which adjusts the term to our calendar year budget; and 
· Annual increases will be based on the 10-year rolling average of the CPI-Transportation Index 

with a floor of 2% and a max of 5%, rather than the current 4.75% (see attached CPI-T history). 
 
Based on Republic’s history of high customer service and satisfaction, significantly reduced rates, and 
accommodation of all Village requests in negotiations, staff recommends approval of this contract 
extension. If approved by the Committee, staff will present the revised contract to the Board. 
 
ALTERNATIVES: 

· Pursue an RFP 
· Discretion of the Committee 

 
RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends approval of the contract extension. 
 
BUDGET IMPACT: 10.4% cumulative reduction (approximately $181,368 in savings in 2014). 
 
ACTION REQUIRED: Approve the Contract Terms. 











Comparison of 10 year history of 1-Year Rolling CPI Average versus 
10-year Rolling CPI-Transportation Index Average 

 

 
Rolling Average 

 CPI CPI-T 10 
YEAR 

 2003 2.30% 1.90% 
2004 2.70% 1.97% 
2005 3.40% 2.33% 
2006 3.20% 2.47% 
2007 2.80% 2.58% 
2008 3.80% 3.35% 
2009 -0.40% 2.11% 
2010 1.60% 2.37% 
2011 3.20% 3.35% 
2012 2.10% 3.60% 

 



  
 

 

12 South Center Street 
Bensenville, IL 60106 
 
Office: 630.766.8200 
Fax: 630.350.3434 
www.bensenville.il.us  
 

 

VILLAGE BOARD 
 
President 
Frank Soto 
 
Trustees 
Morris Bartlett 
Susan V. Janowiak 
Robert “Bob” Jarecki 
Martin O’Connell 
JoEllen Ridder 
Henry Wesseler 
 
Village Clerk 
Ilsa Rivera- Trujillo 
 
Village Manager 
Michael J. Cassady 

VILLAGE BOARD  
 PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE MEETING 

AGENDA  
7:00 P.M. -  Tuesday June 11, 2013 

Bensenville Village Hall, 12 S. Center Street, Bensenville IL  60106 
  
 
Call to Order 
Pledge of Allegiance   
Roll Call 
Approval of Minutes:  May 21, 2013 
   
       
ACTION ITEMS 

1. Consideration of  Allowing Video Gaming in the Village of Bensenville 

2. As Submitted 

INFORMATIONAL ITEMS 

1. Discussion Regarding Taqueria Mi Tierra Application for a Class E2 
Liquor License  

2. Discussion Regarding Main Street News Stand, LLC Application for a 
Class F Liquor License 

Adjournment 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Village of Bensenville
Village Board Room

12 South Center Street
Bensenville, Illinois 60106

Counties of DuPage and Cook

MINUTES OF THE PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE MEETING
May 21, 2013

CALL TO ORDER: Co-Chairwoman Ridder called the meeting to order at 6:00 p.m.

PRESENT: Upon roll call by Deputy Village Clerk, Corey Williamsen, the
following Board Members were present:

Bartlett, Jarecki, Ridder, Wesseler

Absent: President Soto, Chairman O’ Connell, Janowiak

A quorum was present.

Village Clerk, Ilsa Rivera-Trujillo was also present.

Staff Present: Caracci, Cassady, DiSanto, Kosman, Rysavy, Sloth,
Williamsen

Approval of
Minutes: The April 16, 2013 Public Safety Committee Meeting Minutes were

presented.

Motion: Trustee Wesseler made a motion to approve the minutes as
presented. Trustee Jarecki seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Northeast DuPage
Youth & Family
Services: Police Chief, Frank Kosman, presented to the Committee a

resolution authorizing the payment for the annual Northeast
DuPage Youth and Family Services Contribution for Fiscal Year
2013.

There were no questions from the Committee.



Minutes of the Public Safety Committee Meeting
May 21, 2013 Page 2

Chairman O’Connell entered the meeting at 6:04 p.m.

Motion: Trustee Wesseler made a motion to approve this item for
placement on a future Village Board Meeting Agenda for action.
Trustee Bartlett seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

President Soto entered the meeting at 6:06 p.m.

As Submitted: Trustee Wesseler asked that the video gambling discussion be
place on the next Public Safety Committee for further discussion.

Informational
Items: There were no informational items.

ADJOURNMENT: Trustee Bartlett made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Trustee
Ridder seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Chairman O’Connell adjourned the meeting at 6:08 p.m.

Corey Williamsen
Deputy Village Clerk
PASSED AND APPROVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Bensenville this day, June 2013



TYPE:  Ordinance SUBMITTED BY:    Dan Di Santo      DATE: June 11, 2013 
 
DESCRIPTION:   Consider allowing Video Gaming in the Village of Bensenville. 
 

SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 
X Financially Sound Village  Enrich the lives of Residents 
 Quality Customer Oriented Services X Major Business/Corporate Center 
X Safe and Beautiful Village  Vibrant Major Corridors 
 

COMMITTEE ACTION: VM Report – Considered Referendum 
                                           AF&L – Tabled Referendum Question 

DATE: January 15, 2013 
            January 22, 2013 

 
BACKGROUND: The State passed The Video Gaming Act as Public Act 96-34, which became effective on 
July 13, 2009 as a means of funding the State Capital Bill.   On September 11, 2012, the Village of 
Bensenville exercised its right in The Video Gaming Act and passed Ordinance 45-2012 amending Section 
4-3-23 of the Bensenville Village Code to prohibit Video Gaming within the Village. Earlier this year the 
Village Board considered placing an advisory referendum on the April 9, 2013 ballot asking residents 
whether they support or oppose Video Gaming in Bensenville.  However, at the January 22, 2013 Village 
Board meeting, consideration of the Video Gaming Referendum was tabled. 
 
KEY ISSUES: At the May 21, 2013 Public Safety Committee meeting, Trustee Wesseler asked that 
consideration of Video Gaming be placed on the next Public Safety Committee agenda for consideration.  
 
Attached is a map showing nearby municipalities that allow or prohibit Video Gaming.  Since last 
considered, the only amendment to the map is that Stone Park now allows Video Gaming.  The following is a 
summary of provisions included in The Video Gaming Act: 

· Gaming machines are allowed in any bar, restaurant, fraternal organization or veteran’s organization 
possessing a valid liquor license to serve alcohol for consumption on the premises; 

· Authorized establishments cannot be located within 100 feet of a school or place of worship;  
· No more than five Video Gaming machines are allowed per authorized establishment;  
· Video gaming terminals must be located in an area restricted to persons over 21 years of age and in 

the view of an employee;  
· Video gaming is only permitted during the hours when alcohol can be consumed; and  
· The Illinois Gaming Board regulates and enforces Video Gaming.  

 
Additional information on Video Gaming’s impact on Bensenville, including a listing of the 13 businesses 
that would be eligible to participate, is attached. 
 
The Chief of Police is currently surveying municipalities that allow Video Gaming to determine if there are 
any law enforcement concerns.  He will present his findings during the June 11 meeting. When the Chief last 
surveyed these communities in January, no issues existed. 
 
ALTERNATIVES: 

· Discretion of the Board 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Consider allowing Video Gaming in the Village of Bensenville.   
 
BUDGET IMPACT: Municipalities receive a 5% tax on gaming revenues within their corporate limits. In 
addition, the Village can impose a $25 fee on Video Gaming terminals. Some projections show that an 
establishment can earn up to $30,000/year per machine for a total of $150,000 in revenue per year.  
Revenues for the Village under that scenario could be approximately $2,000/year per machine, or about 
$10,000/year per establishment with the maximum of 5 machines.  If the Village allowed Video Gaming, we 
estimate income to the Village could be approximately $75,000 per year.   
 
ACTION REQUIRED: Consider allowing Video Gaming in the Village of Bensenville.   



 

Elk Grove 
YES 

 
Rosemont 

NO 
  

Villa Park 
YES 

  

Park Ridge 
NO 

  

Des Plaines 
NO 

  

Elmhurst 
NO 

  

Franklin Park 
YES 

  

Schiller Park 
NO 

  

Addison 
YES 

  

Itasca 
NO 

  Wood Dale 
YES 

  

Lombard 
NO 

  

Glen Ellyn 
NO 

  
Wheaton 

NO 
  

Bensenville 
NO 

  

Northlake 
Vets Only 

  Stone Park 
YES 

  Berkeley 
YES 

  Hillside 
YES 

  

Bellwood 
YES 

  

Glendale Heights 
NO 

  Carol Stream 
Liquor Licenses Only 

  

West Chicago 
NO 

  

Bloomingdale 
NO 

  

Schaumburg 
NO 

  

Roselle 
NO 

  

Hanover Park 
YES 

  Bartlett 
YES 

  

Streamwood 
NO 

  

Melrose Park 
YES 

  
Maywood 

NO 
  

Forest Park 
NO 

  

River Grove 
YES 

  

River Forest 
NO 

  Oak Park 
NO 

  

Elmwood Park 
NO 

  

Norridge 
NO 

  

Harwood Heights 
NO 

  

Niles 
NO 

  

Morton Grove 
YES 

  

Video Gaming in Surrounding Municipalities 



Provisions of the Act 
• Authorizes up to 5 gaming terminals in licensed establishments 

where liquor is served for consumption on the premises, as 
well as in licensed fraternal establishments, licensed veterans 
establishments, and licensed truck stops; 

• Authorized establishments cannot be located within 100 feet of 
a school or place of worship or 1,000 feet from a horse track 
or casino;  

• Video gaming terminals must be located in an area restricted 
to persons over 21 years of age and in the view of an 
employee;  

• Video gaming is only permitted during the hours when alcohol 
can be consumed; and  

• The Illinois Gaming Board regulates and enforces video 
gaming. 



Enforcement 

• The Illinois Gaming Board regulate and 
enforce video gaming 
– Real-time monitoring of every machine 

• Penalties for violations range from a $100 
fine to a Class 4 felony 

• For certain offenses, the establishment may 
lose its video gaming and/or liquor license 



Potential Establishments In Bensenville 

Class A: 
Village of Bensenville (Redmond Park/Edge Ice Arena) 

Monty’s – 303 South York Road 
Cascade Banquets – 800 West Irving Park Road 

DeCampana – 229 West Grand Avenue 
3 J’s – 206 West Green Street 

Inn Between – 1300 West Irving Park Road 
Valente’s – 410 East Green Street 

Class E1: 
Jade Dragon – 1075 South York Road 

Two Chef’s – 3 South Center Street 
Cancun Mexican Restaurant – 220 North York Road 

Bell Vista Banquets – 207 West Main Street 
Mamma Maria’s – 438 South York Road 

Class E2: 
Bacci Pizza – 100 South Route 83 

 



Revenue Sharing 
• Establishment and Operator each get 35% of revenues 
• 30% tax on video gaming revenues 

– 25% goes to the State 
– 5% goes to the local government 

• Municipality can impose a $25 fee for every video 
gaming terminal 

• Projections show that an establishment can earn 
around $30,000/year per machine for a total of 
$150,000 in revenue per year.   

• Revenues for the Village under that scenario could be 
approximately $2,000/year per machine, or about 
$10,000/year per establishment with the maximum of 
5 machines.   
 



Municipal Revenue Projections 

• 13 Eligible Establishments 
• $2,000 – Average Annual Municipal 

Revenue/Machine/Year 
• $10,000 – Average Annual Municipal 

Revenue/Establishment with 5 machines/Year 
• $50,000 – Estimate with 5 Fully Participating 

Establishments 
• $100,000 – Estimate with 10 Fully 

Participating Establishments 
 



1 
 

Frequently Asked Questions regarding Video Gaming  
Updated July 2012 

 
Please note that some FAQs have been renumbered and reorganized since the 

last version of this document was posted in April 2012.   
 
Q1: Does the IGB have jurisdiction over “amusement only” devices in Illinois? 
 
A1: The IGB does not license “amusement only” devices in Illinois.  Questions about the licensure of such 

devices should be directed to the Illinois Department of Revenue at (312) 814-5232 (Chicago) or (217) 
782-3336 (Springfield). 

 
 Beginning August 18, 2012, it will be a felony to possess simulated video gaming devices equipped with 

a credit reset mechanism or meter.  Licensed Video Gaming Locations may continue to possess crane 
games, vending machines, coin-in-the-slot games and redemption machines as defined in Section 28 of 
the Illinois Criminal Code. 

 
Q2: Can local jurisdictions restrict the use of VGTs? 
 
A2: Yes.  Pursuant to Section 27 of the Video Gaming Act (the “Act”), a municipality may pass an 

ordinance prohibiting video gaming within the corporate limits of the municipality.  A county board may 
pass an ordinance prohibiting video gaming within the unincorporated areas of the county.  In addition, 
pursuant to Section 70 of the Act, a local government may hold a referendum proposing to prohibit 
video gaming in the municipality.     

 
A list of all Illinois municipalities and an indication of whether or not video gaming is allowed in each 
municipality is posted on the IGB website and is updated on a daily basis.  If you have any questions 
about the status of your community, please contact your local municipal authority.   

 
Q3:   What type of documentation is required to meet the definition of a Licensed Truck Stop 

Establishment? 
 
A3: An affidavit confirming that the facility is at least 3 acres (owned or leased land) and has average 

monthly sales of more than 10,000 gallons of diesel or biodiesel fuel per month (which may be met by 
showing estimated future sales or past sales).  Supporting documentation for these factors must be 
attached to the affidavit.  The affidavit will be provided to you by the IGB Agent investigating your 
location application.      

   
Q4:   What type of documentation is required to meet the definition of Licensed Fraternal or Veterans 

Establishment? 
 
A4:   A copy of the most recent letter from the Internal Revenue Service stating that the Applicant 

organization is either a fraternal benefit society that is exempt from federal income tax under section 
501(c)(8) of the Internal Revenue Code, a domestic fraternal society that is exempt from federal income 
tax under section 501(c)(10) of the Internal Revenue Code, or a veterans organization that is exempt 
from federal income tax under section 501(c)(19) of the Internal Revenue Code. 

 



2 
 

Q5: Does a Licensed Distributor who is distributing VGTs also need a Supplier’s license to supply 
replacement parts for the VGTs it distributes? 

 
A5: No.  A Licensed Distributor is defined as “[a]n Individual, partnership corporation or limited liability 

company licensed under the Act to buy, sell, lease or distribute Video Gaming Terminals or major 
components or parts of Video Gaming Terminals to or from Terminal Operators.” 

 
Q6: Can an individual who owns a bar also be licensed as a Terminal Operator?   
 
A6: Yes, as long as the bar in question is NOT a Licensed Video Gaming Location.  In other words, the bar 

in question may not participate in video gaming, regardless of who would serve as its Terminal 
Operator. 

 
 An employee of a Terminal Operator who is NOT an owner, nor shares in the revenue of the Terminal 

Operator in any manner, may own a bar and that bar may participate in video gaming.    
 
Q7: How will the distance restrictions in Section 25(h) of the Act be measured? 
 
A7: Video gaming is restricted from the following locations: 
 

1) 1,000 feet of a facility operated by an organization licensee, inter-track wagering licensee, or inter-
track wagering location licensee licensed under the Illinois Horse Racing Act of 1975 (the Board 
may waive this restriction in certain circumstances);  

2) 1,000 feet of the home dock of a riverboat licensed under the Riverboat Gambling Act (the Board 
may waive this restriction in certain circumstances); or  

3) 100 feet of either a school or a place of worship under the Religious Corporation Act. 
 
 These distances will be determined by measuring the distance from a proposed or existing Licensed 

Video Gaming Location to a preexisting facility, riverboat, school or place of worship by drawing a 
straight line between the closest part of any building used for the proposed or existing Licensed Video 
Gaming Location and the closest part of any building used for the facility, riverboat, school or place of 
worship. When located within a subsection of property by virtue of a lease, deed, or other arrangement 
(e.g., a tenant in a shopping center or commercial condominium), measurement shall be from the 
subsection of property (i.e., boundaries of the establishment's leased building premises). 

 
 For purposes of these restrictions, “home dock” is interpreted to mean the casino building or vessel (i.e., 

the building or vessel housing the casino floor).  
 
 Waiver of Distance Restrictions:  If your proposed Licensed Video Gaming Location is located within 

1,000 feet of a facility operated by an organization licensee, inter-track wagering licensee, inter-track 
wagering location licensee, or the home dock of a riverboat and you would like to request a waiver of 
the distance restrictions in the Act, please request a waiver in writing, addressed to the Administrator of 
the Illinois Gaming Board.  The factors that will be considered by the Board in determining whether to 
grant a waiver include the number and character of other Licensed Locations in the municipality or the 
subdivision of the municipality; whether the proposed Licensed Location has obtained all other 
necessary governmental licenses and permits; the history of liquor law violations and reported criminal 
activity at the proposed Licensed Location; and any other factor that would be relevant to deciding 
whether public interest, convenience and advantage would be served by approving the waiver.   

 



3 
 

Q8:   Must Licensed Video Gaming Location applicants enter into a signed Use Agreement with a 
Terminal Operator before they can submit an application to the IGB? 
 

A8: No, a signed Use Agreement is not required for a potential Licensed Video Gaming Location to submit 
an application.  However, a Licensed Video Gaming Location must have a signed Use Agreement with a 
Licensed Terminal Operator prior to the placement of any VGTs in the Licensed Video Gaming 
Location’s establishment.  

 
    Q9: If an entity that has been doing business in Illinois for 48 months prior to July 13, 2009 forms a 

subsidiary to conduct its video gaming business in Illinois (and would therefore be the Applicant 
for licensure), would that subsidiary meet the residency requirement (i.e., would the subsidiary 
meet the requirement that it has been doing business in Illinois for 48 months)? 

 
A9: If an entity who meets the residency requirement forms a 100% wholly owned subsidiary to conduct its 

video gaming business in Illinois, that 100% wholly owned subsidiary meets the residency requirement.  
Please note that this answer is limited to a 100% wholly owned subsidiary. 

 
Q10: Section 3(c) of the Manufacturer/Distributor/Supplier License Application requires 5% or greater 

shareholders of a publicly-traded parent company of an applicant to submit a Personal Disclosure 
Form or Business Entity Disclosure Form.  How is this requirement being applied to institutional 
investors/investment advisors that hold the interest for investment purposes and certify in an SEC 
Schedule 13-G filing that the interest is not for the purpose of controlling the applicant? 

 
A10: A form for Institutional Investors is currently available on the IGB website.   
 
Q11: Section 5(A) of the Manufacturer/Distributor/Supplier License Application and Section 4(A) of 

the Business Entity Disclosure Form require financial statements for a period ending 1 month 
prior to the date of application.  Will the most recently filed SEC reports for a publicly traded 
company satisfy this requirement? 

 
A11: Yes.  If reference is made to SEC reports, it is sufficient if the applicant identifies where those reports 

can be found on the internet.   
 
Q12: Convertible debt is included in the definition of ownership.  Does each person who holds 

convertible debt have to file a Personal Disclosure Form? 
 
A12: The Applicant/Licensee must identify each person who holds convertible debt and provide a copy of the 

applicable debt instrument(s) and associated agreement(s) with the application or upon issuance of the 
convertible debt.  The Board will make a determination as to the debt holder’s influence and/or control 
over the Applicant/Licensee consistent with section 430 of the Video Gaming Rules.  The holder of 
convertible debt must submit a Video Gaming Personal Disclosure Form and any other required 
document and receive prior Board approval in order to convert the debt. 

 
Q13: Are VGTs allowed anywhere inside a Licensed Video Gaming Location? 
 
A13: VGTs must be located in an area restricted to persons 21 years of age and over, the entrance to which is 

within the view of at least one employee who is over 21 years of age.  The placement of VGTs in 
Licensed Video Gaming Locations is subject to section 810 of the Video Gaming Rules.  For all 
Locations that restrict admittance to patrons 21 years of age or older, a separate restricted area is not 
required.  For all Locations that admit individuals under the age of 21, a physical barrier to the gaming 



4 
 

area, including but not limited to a short partition, gate or rope is required.  No barrier shall visually 
obscure the entrance to the gaming area from an employee of the Location who is over the age of 21.  

 
Q14: May the entrance to the VGT area in a Licensed Video Gaming Location be monitored via closed 

circuit television?   
 
A14: The entrance to the VGT area of a Location must be within the view of at least one employee who is 

over 21 years of age.  While a Location may utilize closed circuit television to monitor the entrance to 
the area in addition to an employee, it may not utilize closed circuit television in lieu of an employee.   

 
Q15:   Are there limits on the hours of operation of a VGT? 
 
A15:   Yes.  Pursuant to Sections 35(b)(2) and 55 of the Act, hours of operation of a VGT must coincide with 

the legal hours of operation for the consumption of alcoholic beverages on the premises.  However, a 
Licensed Truck Stop Establishment that does not hold a liquor license may operate VGTs on a 
continuous basis.  

 
Q16: Are multi-game VGTs permitted under the Video Gaming Act? 
 
A16: Yes, provided that the games have been tested and approved. 
 
Q17: Will Licensed Manufacturers need secondary approval for their VGTs? 
 
A17: Yes.  All VGTs must be (1) certified by Gaming Laboratories International pursuant to the IGB’s 

current Technical Standards for Video Gaming Terminals in Illinois, and (2) approved in writing by the 
IGB for use in Illinois.   

 
Q18: Is compensating or paying a third party a percentage of revenue from a VGT(s) permitted? 
 
A18: Compensating any third party based on a percentage of revenue from a VGT is permitted, however, any 

third party compensated in such a manner is required to complete a Video Gaming Personal Disclosure 
Form or a Business Entity Disclosure Form.  Financing the purchase of VGTs based on a percentage of 
revenue is not permitted. 

 
Q19:   Has the IGB developed standards to identify an illegal inducement by a Licensed Terminal 

Operator? 
 
A19:   Yes.  The IGB’s Inducement Policy is posted on the IGB website.  
 
Q20:   Are licensees allowed to use player tracking systems or establish “Players’ Clubs” or similar 

programs that provide rewards to customers for repeated play?   
 

A20:   Tracking systems and Players Clubs may be authorized by the IGB in the future but are prohibited at this 
time. 

 
Q21: Will a Licensed Manufacturer, Licensed Terminal Operator or Licensed Location be permitted to 

attach an online monitoring system to the second port of a VGT? 
 
A21: Yes; however, the system will require approval by Gaming Laboratories International and the IGB. 
 



5 
 

Q22: Are Licensed Terminal Operators required to maintain a separate bank account for each 
Licensed Location, as provided in Rule 250(i)?   

 
A22: The IGB is taking steps to eliminate the Rule that requires Licensed Terminal Operators to maintain 

separate bank accounts for each Licensed Location it contracts with.  However, the Video Gaming Act 
still requires that revenues generated from the play of VGTs be deposited by the Licensed Terminal 
Operator in one specially created, separate bank account maintained by the Licensed Terminal Operator 
to allow for electronic fund transfers of moneys for tax payment. 

 
Q23: May one Licensed Terminal Operator manage the Use Agreements (or other functions) of another 

Licensed Terminal Operator?   
 
A23: While a Licensed Terminal Operator may be allowed to delegate certain functions to another Licensed 

Terminal Operator, it may not delegate its obligations under the Act.  Before the IGB will approve this 
type of arrangement, it will need to review any proposed management agreement.    

 
Questions Regarding Licensed Technicians and Licensed Terminal Handlers: 

 
Q24. Who needs to obtain a Technician license under the Video Gaming Act? 
 
A24. If an individual is a Licensed Terminal Operator, or is employed by a Licensed Terminal Operator, 
 Licensed Distributor or Licensed Manufacturer, that individual may service, maintain or repair a VGT 
 without obtaining a Technician license.  Any other individual who services, maintains or repairs a VGT 
 must obtain a Technician license under the Act.  Licensed technicians can repair, service and maintain 
 only outside the innermost locked area of a VGT which houses the electronic logic components that 
 have the potential to significantly influence the operation of the VGT.  Thus, a licensed Technician can 
 handle repairs and maintenance such as refilling printer paper, repairing bill validators, resetting tilted 
 Terminals, repairing video displays, etc. 
 
 Third party individuals under contract with a Licensed Terminal Operator, Licensed Manufacturer or 
 Licensed Distributor will not be considered “employees” of the Licensee.  Therefore, those individuals 
 will need to apply for a Technician license in order to service, maintain or repair a VGT.   
 
Q25. Who needs to obtain a Terminal Handler license under the Video Gaming Act? 
 
A25. Any individual needing access to the inner workings of a VGT and/or needing to possess or control a 

VGT. “Inner workings” comprises the separately-locked logic area inside of a VGT which houses 
electronic components that have the potential to significantly influence the operation of the VGT, 
including:  (1) the game’s central processing unit(s), (2) communication controller electronics and 
components housing the communication storage device, and (3) the memory back-up device. 

 
Q26: Can an individual be licensed as a Licensed Technician and a Licensed Terminal Handler? 
 
A26: Yes.  An individual can obtain both licenses.  Additionally, a Licensed Terminal Handler may perform 

all the duties of a Licensed Technician without having to separately obtain a Technician license.  A 
Licensed Technician may not perform the duties of a Licensed Terminal Handler without obtaining a 
Terminal Handler license. 

 
Q27: Must employees of a Licensed Manufacturer be licensed as Terminal Handlers to access the inner 

workings of a VGT during the manufacturing process at the Licensed Manufacturer’s location? 



6 
 

 
A27: No.  Employees of a Licensed Manufacturer who manufacture VGTs at a Licensed Manufacturer’s 

location are not required to obtain a Terminal Handler license.  However, if the individual needs to go 
into the field (to a Licensed Location, for example) at any time to service the VGT, he or she will need 
to obtain a Terminal Handler license. 

 
Q28: Does an employee of a Licensed Manufacturer, Licensed Distributor or Licensed Terminal 

Operator need to obtain a Terminal Handler license in order to install machines at a Licensed 
Location? 

 
A28: Individuals who are employed by a Licensed Manufacturer, Licensed Distributor and/or Licensed 

Terminal Operator do not need to obtain a Terminal Handler license in order to have possession or 
control of a VGT for the purpose of installation (i.e., assist in moving the VGTs to the Licensed 
Location and installing the VGTs).  However, the individual still needs a Terminal Handler license if 
that individual is accessing the inner workings of the VGT.      

 
 At any time other than installation at a Licensed Location, if an individual (regardless of whether they 

are employed by a Licensee) possesses or controls a VGT, and/or has access to the inner workings of a 
VGT, he or she must be a Licensed Terminal Handler.    

 
Q29: If a Licensed Terminal Operator hires third party collectors, must they obtain Terminal Handler 

licenses? 
 
A29: A third party collector would likely only need to obtain a Technician license. However, if a third party 

collector will access the inner workings of a VGT, he or she must obtain a Terminal Handler license.     
 

Questions Regarding Payout Systems/Devices: 
 
Q30: What types of payout systems will be allowed by the IGB? 
 
A30: Emergency Rule, Section 1410, addresses what types of payout devices will be allowed by the IGB, and 

was recently filed.  The Rule is posted on the IGB website. 
 
Q31: May a payout device also be an ATM? 
 
A31: Yes.  Rule 1410 contemplates a payout device having ATM capabilities.     
 
Q32: When will the IGB release specifications for how payout systems must connect to the Central 

Communications System? 
 
A32: The “Video Gaming Payout Device Requirements” are posted on the IGB website.   
 
Q33: Does a company who manufactures a payout system need to be licensed? 
 
A33: No. 
 
Q34: Does a company who distributes or supplies a payout system need to be licensed?   
 
A34: Yes.  The company must be licensed as a Distributor or Supplier in order to sell, lease or distribute 

payout systems to Licensed Terminal Operators.      



7 
 

 
Q35: Does a lender for the purchase of payout systems need to register with the IGB? 
 
A35: Pursuant to Rule 910, if a lender intends to enforce a security interest in a payout device, it must register 

with the IGB.  However, pursuant to Rule 930, registration to provide financing, only, is not required. 
 
Q36: Must an individual be licensed in order to service a payout device? 
 
A36: Yes.  The individual must obtain a Technician License to service a payout device.       
 

  Questions Regarding Shipment and Storage of VGTs and Other Gaming Equipment: 
 
Q37: What type of notice does the IGB require in order to ship VGTs? 
 
A37: A licensee may only ship approved VGTs to another licensee.  A Licensed Manufacturer may ship 
 unapproved VGTs to itself, as long as the licensee maintains control and possession of the unapproved 
 VGTs until such time when they are approved.     
 
 The IGB requires 14 days notice of shipment of VGTs, software and payout devices.  A form regarding 
 shipment is posted on the IGB website and must be completed and sent to Angelica Aguilar at 
 angelica.aguilar@igb.illinois.gov and Robert Burke at robert.burke@igb.illinois.gov.   
 
Q38: Do the VGT shipment rules apply to payout devices and software? 
 
A38: Yes.  Please use the same VGT shipment form for payout devices and software.  
 
Q39: Can approved VGTs be shipped directly to a Licensed Location?   
 
A39: Approved VGTs may be shipped directly to a Licensed Location by a Distributor located in the State of 
 Illinois.  
 
Q40: Do licensees need to have secure storage for payout devices? 
 
A40: No.   
 
Q41: Does every Licensed Terminal Operator need to have an approved storage facility?   
 
A41: If a Licensed Terminal Operator intends to take possession of VGTs at any time, it must have an 

approved storage facility.   
 

 
          

 

mailto:angelica.aguilar@igb.illinois.gov
mailto:robert.burke@igb.illinois.gov


TYPE: Discussion SUBMITTED BY:    Corey Williamsen     DATE: June 11, 2013  
 
DESCRIPTION:   Taqueria Mi Tierra Liquor License Request for a Class E2 License (Beer and Wine 
Sales for Consumption On-Premises) 
 

SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 
 Financially Sound Village  Enrich the lives of Residents 
X Quality Customer Oriented Services  Major Business/Corporate Center 
X Safe and Beautiful Village  Vibrant Major Corridors 
 
COMMITTEE ACTION: Public Safety  DATE: June 11, 2013 
 
BACKGROUND: Section 3-3-5E2.3 of the Bensenville Village Code limits the number of Class E2 
liquor licenses issued and outstanding to 1.  Class E2 licenses authorize the retail sale of beer and wine for 
consumption on the premises when food is offered. Taqueria Mi Tierra, located at 459 West Irving Park 
Road, applied for a Class E2 Liquor License in May, 2013.  
  
Staff has not begun the necessary preparation of the liquor license applicant. Staff is seeking direction 
from the Village Board prior to the conduction of a background check and inspection of the property. If 
the direction from the Village Board is to proceed with the ordinance amendment, Staff will begin the 
process of a background check and inspection. Once everything is complete, Staff will present the 
ordinance amendment at a future Village Board Meeting for final action.    
 
KEY ISSUES: The current Village Code allows for no more than one (1) Class E2 liquor licenses to be 
issued. Currently the only license is issued to Bacci Pizza. In order to issue a Class E2 liquor license to 
Taqueria Mi Tierra, the Village Board would have to increase the number of total licenses from 1 to 2.  
 
ALTERNATIVES: 

· Discretion of the Committee 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Staff has concerns about issuing this liquor license as it would fundamentally 
alter the current use of this taqueria.   The only other taqueria that has a liquor license at this time is 
Cancun Mexican Restaurant. 
  
BUDGET IMPACT: $2,300 of net revenue for the Village.  
 
ACTION REQUIRED: Action on this item is at the discretion of the Committee. 



Liquor License as of June, 2013
Name Address Class
Village of Bensenville - Redmond Recreational Complex 735 E. Jefferson A
Monty’s Elegant Banquets, Inc. 703 S. York Road A
Sher-A-Punjab Restaurant & Banquets, Inc. DBA Cascade Banquets, Inc. 800 W. Irving Park Road A
DeCampana Restaurant, Inc 229 W. Grand Ave A
3 J's Tavern 206 W. Green Street A
Inn Between 1300 W. Irving Park Road A
Valente's 410 E. Green Street A
Forest Liquor, Inc. 22 E. Green Street B
Dominicks Finer Foods, LLC 1127 S. York Road B
IS Discount Liquor 460 W. Irving Park Road B
Brentwood Liquors Grand & Spirits 105 W. Grand Ave B
Foremost Liquor & Grocery 1045 S. York Road B
Walgreen's Co. DBA Walgreen's #09024 5 W. Irving Park Road B
Highland Park CVS, LLC DBA CVS/Pharmacy #4995 700 West Irving Park Road B
El Toreo Market, Inc. 229 W. Grand Ave B
Jade Dragon Restaurant, Inc. 1075 S. York Road E-1
Burcall Corp. DBA Two Chef's 3 S. Center Street E-1
Cancun Mexican Restaurant, Inc. 220 N. York Road E-1
Bella Vista Main Street Pizza 207 W. Main Street E-1
Mamma Maria's Pizzeria Bensenville, Inc. 438 S. York Road E-1
Bacci Pizza 100 South Route 83 E-2
Edmar Foods, Inc. 219 W. Main Street F
MJ Food & Beer 1213 W. Irving Park Road F
Addison Fresh Market, Inc. DBA Jimenez Express & Bakery 469 - 473 W. Irving Park Road F
Pantry Plus AMI & Tammy, Inc. 718 W. Irving Park Road F



















TYPE: Discussion SUBMITTED BY:    Corey Williamsen     DATE: June 11, 2013  
 
DESCRIPTION:   Main Street News Stand, LLC Liquor License Request for a Class F License 
(Packaged Beer and Wine Sales) 

 
SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 

 Financially Sound Village  Enrich the lives of Residents 
X Quality Customer Oriented Services  Major Business/Corporate Center 
X Safe and Beautiful Village  Vibrant Major Corridors 
 
COMMITTEE ACTION: Public Safety DATE: June 11, 2013 
 
BACKGROUND: Section 3-3-5F.3 of the Bensenville Village Code limits the number of Class F liquor 
licenses issued and outstanding to 4.  Class F licenses authorize the retail sale of packaged beer and wine 
not for consumption on the premises. Main Street News Stand, LLC, located at 119 West Main Street, 
applied for a Class F Liquor License in May, 2013.  
  
At this time staff has not begun the necessary preparation of the liquor license applicant. Staff is seeking 
direction from the Village Board prior to the conduction of a background check and inspection of the 
property. If the direction from the Village Board is to proceed with the ordinance amendment, Staff will 
begin the process of a background check and inspection. Once everything is complete, Staff will present 
the ordinance amendment at a future Village Board Meeting for final action.    
 
KEY ISSUES: The current Village Code allows for no more than four (4) Class F liquor licenses to be 
issued. Currently all four licenses are issued to the following: Pantry Plus, Edmar, M.J. Food and Beer, 
and Jimenez. In order to issue a Class F liquor license to Main Street New Stand, LLC, the Village Board 
would have to increase the number of total licenses from 4 to 5.  
 
ALTERNATIVES: 

· Discretion of the Committee 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Staff has concerns about issuing this liquor license as it would fundamentally 
alter the current use of this Downtown newsstand.   
 
BUDGET IMPACT: $1,950 of net revenue for the Village.  
 
ACTION REQUIRED: Action on this item is at the discretion of the Committee. 



Liquor License as of June, 2013
Name Address Class
Village of Bensenville - Redmond Recreational Complex 735 E. Jefferson A
Monty’s Elegant Banquets, Inc. 703 S. York Road A
Sher-A-Punjab Restaurant & Banquets, Inc. DBA Cascade Banquets, Inc. 800 W. Irving Park Road A
DeCampana Restaurant, Inc 229 W. Grand Ave A
3 J's Tavern 206 W. Green Street A
Inn Between 1300 W. Irving Park Road A
Valente's 410 E. Green Street A
Forest Liquor, Inc. 22 E. Green Street B
Dominicks Finer Foods, LLC 1127 S. York Road B
IS Discount Liquor 460 W. Irving Park Road B
Brentwood Liquors Grand & Spirits 105 W. Grand Ave B
Foremost Liquor & Grocery 1045 S. York Road B
Walgreen's Co. DBA Walgreen's #09024 5 W. Irving Park Road B
Highland Park CVS, LLC DBA CVS/Pharmacy #4995 700 West Irving Park Road B
El Toreo Market, Inc. 229 W. Grand Ave B
Jade Dragon Restaurant, Inc. 1075 S. York Road E-1
Burcall Corp. DBA Two Chef's 3 S. Center Street E-1
Cancun Mexican Restaurant, Inc. 220 N. York Road E-1
Bella Vista Main Street Pizza 207 W. Main Street E-1
Mamma Maria's Pizzeria Bensenville, Inc. 438 S. York Road E-1
Bacci Pizza 100 South Route 83 E-2
Edmar Foods, Inc. 219 W. Main Street F
MJ Food & Beer 1213 W. Irving Park Road F
Addison Fresh Market, Inc. DBA Jimenez Express & Bakery 469 - 473 W. Irving Park Road F
Pantry Plus AMI & Tammy, Inc. 718 W. Irving Park Road F



































  
 

 

12 South Center Street 
Bensenville, IL 60106 
 
Office: 630.766.8200 
Fax: 630.350.3434 
www.bensenville.il.us  
 

 

VILLAGE BOARD 
 
President 
Frank Soto 
 
Trustees 
Morris Bartlett 
Susan V. Janowiak 
Robert “Bob” Jarecki 
Martin O’Connell 
JoEllen Ridder 
Henry Wesseler 
 
Village Clerk 
Ilsa Rivera- Trujillo 
 
Village Manager 
Michael J. Cassady 

VILLAGE BOARD  
 COMMUNITY & ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE 

MEETING 
AGENDA  

7:15 P.M. Or Immediately Following the Board of Trustees 
Meeting  

Tuesday, June 11, 2013 
Bensenville Village Hall, 12 S. Center Street, Bensenville IL  60106 

 
Call to Order 
Roll Call 
Approval of Minutes:  May 21, 2013 
      
ACTION ITEMS 

 
1. Consideration of Eliminating Real Estate Transfer Inspections (RETI) Except 

in Cases of Foreclosures 

2. As Submitted  

INFORMATIONAL ITEMS 

1. Discussion Regarding Creation of a Façade Improvement Program 

2. Discussion Regarding a Review of Current Zoning Ordinance Requirements 
for Detached Garages and Sheds 

Adjournment  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Village of Bensenville
Village Board Room

12 South Center Street
Bensenville, Illinois 60106

Counties of DuPage and Cook

MINUTES OF THE COMMUNITY & ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
COMMITTEE MEETING

May 21, 2013

CALL TO ORDER: Chairman Jarecki called the meeting to order at 6:09 p.m.

PRESENT: Upon roll call by Deputy Village Clerk, Corey Williamsen, the
following Board Members were present:

Chairman Jarecki, President Soto, Bartlett, O’Connell, Ridder
Wesseler

Absent: Janowiak

A quorum was present.

Village Clerk, Ilsa Rivera-Trujillo was also in attendance.

Staff Present: Cassady, Caracci, DiSanto, Kosman, Rysavy, Sloth,
Williamsen

Approval of
Minutes: The April 16, 2013 Community & Economic Development

Committee minutes were presented.

Motion: Trustee Ridder made a motion to approve the minutes as
presented. Trustee Bartlett seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.



Minutes of the Community & Economic Development Committee Meeting
May 21, 2013 Page 2

Electric Code
Amendments: Assistant Director of Community & Economic Development, Mark

Rysavy, presented to the Committee an ordinance for the adoption
of the 2012 Illinois Energy Code and amendments to the 2008
National Electric Code.

There were no questions from the Committee.

Motion: President Soto made a motion to approve this item for placement
on a future Village Board Meeting Agenda for action as presented.
Trustee Bartlett seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

602 N. York Rd.: Assistant Director of Community & Economic Development, Mark
Rysavy, presented to the Committee an ordinance granting
approval of a conditional use permit amendment to Ordinance #83-
2012 to allow for the installation of an additional antenna at 602
York Road, American Tower Corporation.

There were no questions from the Committee.

Motion: Trustee Wesseler made a motion to approve this item for
placement on a future Village Board Meeting Agenda for action as
presented. Trustee Ridder seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

AS SUBMITTED: Trustee Ridder asked for an update on the Neighborhood
Stabilization Program.

Trustee Ridder asked Staff to prepare a report of foreclosed
property, property for sale and property sold from the last year.

Trustee Ridder asked for an update on the McDonald’s approved
by the Board at Irving Park Road and Mason Street. Mr. Rysavy
provided an update to the Committee.



Minutes of the Community & Economic Development Committee Meeting
May 21, 2013 Page 3

Trustee Ridder asked for an update regarding Community Signs.
Mr. Cassady stated Staff had received three proposals for the
signs and the matter will be brought forth to the Committee in the
near future.

Trustee Bartlett asked for an update regarding the expansion of
Mamma Maria’s. Mr. Rysavy provided the Committee with an
update.

Trustee Bartlett asked for an update recording memorial bricks for
the Wall that Heals. Mr. Rysavy provided an update to the
Committee.

Trustee Wesseler asked for an update on the grade separation
project. Mr. Caracci provided an update to the Committee.

Trustee Wesseler asked if Residents can purchase old street
signs. Mr. Cassady stated Staff will provide information to the
Committee in the near future.

Trustee Wesseler asked for an update of the CBGB construction of
Wood Avenue. Mr. Caracci provided an update to the Committee.

Trustee Wesseler asked for an update in regards to the Route 83
maiden project. Mr. Caracci provided an update to the Committee.

INFORMATIONAL
ITEMS: There were no informational items.

ADJOURNMENT: Trustee Bartlett made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Trustee
Ridder seconded the motion.

All were in favor. Motion carried.

Chairman Jarecki adjourned the meeting at 6:36 p.m.

Corey Williamsen
Deputy Village Clerk
PASSED AND APPROVED

by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Bensenville this day June, 2013



TYPE:   Motion                SUBMITTED BY:             S. Viger              DATE: 06.11.13 
 
DESCRIPTION:  Elimination of Real Estate Transfer Inspections (RETI) except in cases of Foreclosed 
Properties 

 
SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 

X Financially Sound Village X Enrich the lives of Residents 
X Quality Customer Oriented Services  Major Business/Corporate Center 
X Safe and Beautiful Village  Vibrant Major Corridors 
 
COMMITTEE ACTION: Commercial and Economic Development  DATE:  06.11.13 
 
BACKGROUND:   The Village Code has included a Real Estate Transfer Inspection (RETI) for many 
years. Essentially, RETIs are property inspections conducted by the Village whenever residential 
dwellings are sold.  However, in today’s environment most lenders require buyers to have an independent 
home inspection, making much of our process redundant. The State of Illinois now licenses home 
inspectors through the Department of Financial and Professional Regulation. 
 
During our “Discover Bensenville” focus groups with local real estate professionals in 2012, it was the 
consensus to eliminate the requirement.  Reasoning was widespread and included; over reach of 
government, unnecessary / redundant, and belief that they are causing potential buyers to avoid buying in 
Bensenville. At the 10.13.12 Budget Workshop the Village Board concurred with the elimination of the 
RETI requirement. 
 
KEY ISSUES: There has long been dissatisfaction with the RETI program. Oft heard complaints deal with 
the type of inspection performed; should it be life safety or property maintenance or both. Timing of the 
inspections has also caused concerns within the real estate community. Most inspections have been 
requested by the Sellers only after they have an offer, setting the stage for complaints that the Village 
inspection is souring the sales agreement. It is unclear if the Sellers voice the same concerns regarding the 
lending institutions’ requirement of private home inspections. 
 
Elimination of the RETI will allow staff to focus on the Residential Annual Inspections (DIPs or “rental” 
inspections). Our Code Compliance inspector needs to perform Annual inspections on over 400 rental 
properties. 
 
Instead of simply eliminating RETIs, staff now recommends that we continue RETIs for foreclosed 
properties and eliminate them for all other real estate transactions. As non-owner occupied properties, 
foreclosures are often owned by large out of the area financial institutions. Our belief is that these 
properties, more so than “standard” single family sales, often fall into disrepair and a municipal inspection 
may be warranted.  
 
ALTERNATIVES:  

1. Committee discretion. 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Staff respectfully recommends approval of the request to eliminate the RETI 
requirement except for foreclosed properties. 
 
BUDGET IMPACT: The RETI fee is $55.  
 
ACTION REQUIRED: Motion approving the elimination of the Real Estate Transfer Inspection requirement 
except for foreclosed properties. 



 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 

Date:   06.05.13 
To:   M. Cassady 
From:   S. Viger 
RE:   Real Estate Transfer Inspections 
 
 

The Village has mandated Real Estate Transfer Inspections (RETI) for 
many years. Increasingly the staff is evaluating the RETI program. The 
requirement is found in Municipal Code Section 9 – 2 – 5 which states in 
part: 

 
“Certificate Of Occupancy Requirement: It shall be unlawful to sell, 
convey, trade, give, purchase, receive, or otherwise transfer any one-
family dwelling, a one-family dwelling attached, a condominium 
dwelling, a structure used as a one-family dwelling, or a two-family 
dwelling without having first obtained a certificate of occupancy for 
said dwelling as required by section 10-3-2 of this code. Any person 
selling, conveying, trading, giving, purchasing, receiving or otherwise 
transferring said dwelling without a certificate of occupancy shall be 
subject to the penalties set forth in section 1-4-1 of this code. 
 
Any person owning real estate located within the village shall, at the 
time of offering the real estate for sale or transfer, but not less than 
twenty one (21) days prior to any proposed sale, assignment or other 
transfer of any legal or beneficial interest of said real estate, file an 
application for a certificate of occupancy with the community 
development department. 
 
Upon request of the owner, agent or other persons authorized to sell a 
one-family dwelling, a one-family dwelling attached, a condominium 
dwelling, a structure used as a one-family dwelling, or a two-family 
dwelling (hereinafter referred to as "applicant"), the building official or 
his designee will be available at an appointed time within five (5) 
working days agreed upon by himself and the applicant, or later if 
applicant requests, to inspect such dwelling or structure. The term "five 
(5) working days" in this instance shall mean any five (5) days during a 
given week or part thereof, during regular business hours. 
 
 



If such inspection establishes that the one-family dwelling, one-family 
dwelling attached, a condominium dwelling, a structure used as a 
one-family dwelling, or a two-family dwelling, complies with the 
provisions of this section, then he shall issue a certificate of occupancy 
for said dwelling. The certificate shall indicate the date of the 
inspection; that such dwelling complies with the requirements of this 
section, and the lawful use for which said dwelling was intended. One 
copy of the certificate shall be delivered to or mailed to the applicant. 
A record of all certificates shall be kept on file in the office of the 
community development department and copies shall be furnished, 
upon request, to any person having a proprietary interest or tenancy 
interest in the dwelling affected.” 

 
This is a long way of saying that we inspect a home prior to sale and 
issuance of Certificate of Occupancy. 

 
In today’s environment most home buyers engage a private inspection 
firm often as a requirement of their lending institution. In this situation 
the staff has found the RETI somewhat redundant. They Village has 
received complaints from the real estate industry regarding the RETI, 
often citing them as a factor in potential buyers looking elsewhere. 
During the Discover Bensenville portion of our Neighborhood 
Stabilization Program, we met with real estate professionals from 
around the area and discussed amongst other things the views and 
professional opinions on the RETI requirement. The majority of these 
professionals sought the elimination of the requirement. We heard that 
they were unnecessary, perhaps an unwarranted expansion of 
municipal authority, deal – killing and unlike private inspection firms the 
Village inspectors are not certified by the State of Illinois.  

 
During the budget meetings last fall the consensus of the Board was to 
eliminate the RETI requirement. It was and is the staff’s vision that the 
Code Compliance inspectors can focus on service requests and the 
annual inspections of rental residential properties (the so – called DIP).  
Last fall staff surveyed twelve nearby communities, only two required 
full RETI and four others required a “Clearwater” inspection with six 
having no requirement. 

 
 

Also staff had previously recommended altering the RETI program to a 
simple “Clearwater” inspection. It has been determined that the 
“Clearwater RETI will be unnecessary as we will be replacing every 
water meter in the Village and the “Clearwater” inspection can occur 
at he time of meter replacement. So we have not decided against the 
“Clearwater” inspections, we have just found a better way to get them 



done and get them done on every property not just those that are 
sold. 

 
Staff does propose a modification to the previously discussed RETI 
elimination. We recommend that the Village maintain the requirement 
for non owner occupied vacant (foreclosed properties). As non-owner 
occupied properties foreclosures are often owned by large out of the 
area financial institutions. Our belief is that as these properties more so 
than “standard” single family sales often fall into disrepair and a 
municipal inspection may be warranted.  

 
 



TYPE:    Discussion             SUBMITTED BY:             S. Viger              DATE: 06.11.13 
 
DESCRIPTION: Consideration of a Façade Improvement Program 
 

SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 
X Financially Sound Village X Enrich the lives of Residents 
X Quality Customer Oriented Services X Major Business/Corporate Center 
X Safe and Beautiful Village X Vibrant Major Corridors 
 
COMMITTEE ACTION:  
Commercial and Economic Development  DATE:  06.11.13 

 
BACKGROUND:  The Village Board included the creation of a façade improvement program in the 
2013 Strategic Plan.  The purpose of the program would be to provide assistance to local businesses to 
visually upgrade and enhance their property. The façade program would offer funding in the form of a 
grant program for eligible improvements to commercial facades throughout the Village, with primary 
focus given to the Downtown.  By doing so, it is envisioned that the capital improvement will pay 
dividends to both the business and the general community through improved aesthetics. 
 
KEY ISSUES: Key details of a façade improvement program include the level of Village financial 
participation and exactly how that participation will be structured. Staff suggests the following 
components of the Bensenville program:  

· Each façade be allowed up to a $10,000 grant payable 50% up front and 50% at job completion. 
· Eligible activities would include canopies or awnings, signage, new façade elements, exterior 

lighting and entryway improvements.  
· All building façade work shall front on public streets to be eligible.  

 
If the Committee agrees to these basic parameters, staff can begin developing a more detailed Program for 
approval by the Village Board. 
 
ALTERNATIVES:  

· Discretion of the Committee. 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Staff respectfully requests that the Village Board authorize staff to proceed with 
the formalizing the Façade and Exterior Enhancement Program policy. 
 
BUDGET IMPACT:    The 2013 Budget includes $30,000 for this item.  
 
ACTION REQUIRED: Staff is seeking policy direction form the elected officials. 



 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 

Date:   04.02.13 
To:   M. Cassady 
  D. Di Santo 
From:   S. Viger 
RE:   Draft Façade & Exterior Enhancement Program for Discussion 
 
 
The Village Board Strategic Plan Policy Agenda has Façade Program in 
April 2013.  
 
The 2013 Budget includes $30,000 for this item.  
 
As preparation for the Village Board discussion, the staff (A. Guerrero, M. 
Rysavy, M. Martella and I) reviewed other municipal programs and 
drafted for Bensenville a sample program for review and discussion. 
 
The Façade and Exterior Enhancement Program will offer funding in the 
form of a grant program for eligible improvements to commercial facades 
throughout the Village, with primary focus given to the Downtown Business 
District. The program will assist our local businesses and the overall 
community aesthetic through a reduction of the cost to improve the 
appearance of their properties. Through these improvements, the Village 
seeks to foster an atmosphere that is conducive to business development. 
 
Grants are available up to $10,000 per façade. (The Village Board may 
determine whether funding should be provided simply up to $10,000 or on 
a 50/50 basis up to $10,000.) 
 
These improvements should strengthen the quality of buildings in the 
Village and reflect current aesthetic standards. All improvements must be 
reviewed by the Community & Economic Development Committee and 
approved by the Village Board. In addition, all improvements must 
conform to all Village Zoning and Building Code requirements and any 
other applicable codes and ordinances of the Village of Bensenville.  
Eligible improvements include: 

· Canopies or awnings 
· Signage 
· New façade elements 



· Exterior lighting 
· Entryway improvements 

Building façades must front on public streets to be eligible.  
 
Applicants must submit the appropriate application and supporting 
documentation to the Department of Community and Economic 
Development. Information required in the application includes the 
following: 

· Business Name  
· Property Owner 
· Contact Person  
· Description of Improvements (Why and how it meets the 

requirements of the Program.) 
· Proposed Project Schedule 
· Photographs of Existing Façade 
· Plans/Sketches/Shop Drawings of Proposed Improvements 
· Initial Cost Estimates (Minimum three) 

Applicants should allow ten days for their application to be reviewed by 
the Department of Community & Economic Development. If approved, 
the application will be submitted to the Community & Economic 
Development Committee and Village Board for final recommendations 
and authorization. Upon Village Board approval, the applicant and 
Village will enter into a formal agreement, called the Façade 
Renovation/Rehabilitation Agreement, which will define the scope of 
work and approved grant amount and payment methods. 

· All work must be completed within six months of Village Board 
approval.  

· Any work begun prior to approval will not be eligible for funding 
· Copies of all invoices shall be submitted to the Village as proof of 

costs.  Invoices must match funding amount.  Village will pay 50% 
up front (based on the cost estimate and the final 50% after work is 
completed and final inspection approved by the Village. 

· The Village cannot reimburse in excess of the total amount 
specified in the Façade and Exterior Enhancement Agreement. 

· If the cost exceeds the original estimates, the property owner will be 
responsible for the full amount of the excess. 

Once completed, the applicant must maintain, and may not alter or 
change the improvements for a period of 2 years unless a request for 
modification is presented to the Village Board and approved prior to 
commencing such work.  



If any business removes said façade improvements for any reason in this 2 
year period they must repay the entire grant award in full within six months 
of removal. 
 
General Notes: 
Maintenance items such as tuck-pointing are not eligible. 
Commercial uses regardless of zoning district are eligible. 
One time grant per tenant. 
 
 



TYPE:    Discussion              SUBMITTED BY:             S. Viger              DATE: 06.11.13 
 
DESCRIPTION: Review of current Zoning Ordinance requirements for detached garages 
and sheds. 
 

SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS: 
 Financially Sound Village X Enrich the lives of Residents 
 Quality Customer Oriented Services  Major Business/Corporate Center 
X Safe and Beautiful Village  Vibrant Major Corridors 
 
COMMITTEE ACTION: CEDC DATE:  06.11.13 
 
BACKGROUND: Trustee Jarecki asked staff to review our current regulations covering 
detached garages and sheds to determine if they are overly restrictive and 
unnecessary. Currently Section 10-14-12 (Garages and Sheds in Residential Districts) of 
the Village Code regulates the size of garages based on lot size, with the smallest 
allowable being 484 SQFT for homesites under 7,499 SQFT (a simple 22’ x 22’  two car 
garage), and increasing up to 880 SQFT for homesites 16,000 SQFT and larger. 
 
Sheds are limited to 100 SQFT regardless of homesite size. What may appear odd is the 
maximum combined square footage allowed for all accessory structures on a homesite 
is not the sum of the two maximums, but for all intents and purposes equal to the 
maximum garage size. In other words the Code does not allow a property to both build 
the maximum allowable detached garage and have a shed. 
 
KEY ISSUES:  
With many lots in town only 50’ to 60’ wide, a 700 SQFT garage could occupy 32’ of the 
lot width in the rear yard. If permitted we would have to be accepting of such a 
garage on the majority of our homesites.  The key issues can be categorized into 
aesthetics and quality of life issues for our residents. Larger garages may be 
advantageous to our homeowners, however they also could be seen as detrimental to 
the community aesthetic.   
 
A possible amendment to the Code would allow an additional 100 SQFT to the 
accessory structure maximum, which would allow for both a maximum sized detached 
garage and a shed. 
 
ALTERNATIVES:  

· Discretion of the Committee  
 

RECOMMENDATION:  Staff recommends the Committee review our current regulations 
requirements and provide direction on potential amendments to the Code. 
 
BUDGET IMPACT:   N/A 
 
ACTION REQUIRED: Staff is seeking direction from the Committee. 
 



 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 

Date:   06.05.13 
To:   M. Cassady 
From:   S. Viger 
RE:   Residential garage discussion 
 
 
Currently we regulate the size of the garages based on the lot size 
beginning with a 484 SQFT (a simple 22’ x 22’  two car garage) and 
increasing up to 880 SQFT for homesites 16,000 SQFT and larger. 
 
Sheds are limited to 100 SQFT regardless of homesite size. What may 
appear odd is the maximum allowed on a homesite is NOT the sum of the 
two maximums, but for all intents and purposes equal to the maximum 
garage size.  
 
Here’s Code Section 10 -14 -12: 
 

3. Allowable Sizes For Detached And Attached Structures: Allowable sizes for detached 
and attached garages and sheds: 
 
Single-Family Residential Garage and Shed Size 
 

 
Lot Area    

 
Maximum 
Garage 
Size    

 
Maximum 

Shed Size    

Maximum Accessory 
Building Total 

Square Footage 
Not To Exceed    

   

7,499    484    100    488    

7,500 - 9,299    528    100    532    

9,300 - 10,999    660    100    660    

11,000 - 15,999    748    100    748    

16,000 and up    880    100    880    

 
 
 
 



For example if you have a 51’ x 147’ lot (7,497 SQFT) like the homes on 
Mason Street you could have a two car garage and no shed or a one car 
garage and a shed but not both. 
 
All residential lots regardless of size have a maximum coverage of 50%, this 
is to help with our stormwater management. With half the lot in green 
space it allows some of the storm water to percolate into the ground prior 
to being accepted by our storm sewer system. 
 
These figures were approved by the Village under Ordinance #20 -95. 
Prior to 1995 the Zoning Ordinance allowed one  garage up to 700 SQFT 
per lot and one of “all other accessory structures” up to 300 SQFT with a 
total of 1,000SQFT (the sum of the two maximums).  
 
In 2008 we revised the Zoning Ordinance again to address so – called 
“parking pads” or accessory outdoor parking along alleys for residences. 
The desire of the Village Board at that time was to embark on Code 
Enforcement activities to have these areas paved in accordance with 
Municipal Code and to regulate their size.  Underlying the discussion was 
Municipal Code Section 10 – 11 11 that states in part “No more than 4 
spaces shall be provided per dwelling unit…” Consequently the Code 
says if you have a two car garage you can have two outdoor spaces, a 
three car garage only one outdoor space or a four car garage with no 
outdoor spaces.   
 
A fair question might be; “if you can pave the parking space, why can’t it 
be inside a garage?” This could simply be a question of community 
aesthetics, wide garages covering most of the rear property line along an 
alley home after home is not as nice as alternating garages and open 
spaces (parking). 
 
Staff is providing this information to initiate a policy discussion among the 
Elected officials. 
 
 
 


	061113 Board - Final DR
	1 - 061113 MM - Final - DR
	Village of Bensenville, Illinois

	1.1 - 061113 - Board Agenda
	Village of Bensenville, Illinois

	2 - DRAFT_130528_Board
	2.1 - Warrant 06-11-13 Reports
	3 - GS 6-6-13 Code Revisions
	3.1 - Ordinance
	4 - Exhibit A
	5 -  Memo 2008 NEC amendments
	Bensenville Memo

	6 -Green Sheet 602 N York Road American Tower
	7 - Aerial and Zoning Map
	8 - 602 N York CUP Ordinance
	9 - Revised Staff Report 602 N York Road
	STAFF REPORT
	HEARING DATE:    May 13, 2013
	APPLICANT: Sirius XM
	BUILDING SIZE:   N/A
	SITE ACREAGE:     2891 Square Feet (Leased Area)
	PUBLIC NOTICE:
	1. A Legal Notice was published in the Daily Herald on Saturday April 27, 2013. A Certified copy of the Legal Notice is maintained in the CDC file and is available for viewing and inspection at the Community & Economic Development department during re...
	2. Village personnel posted a Notice of Public Hearing sign on the property, visible from the public way on Friday April 26, 2013.
	3. On Thursday April 25, 2013 Village personnel mailed from the Bensenville Post Office via First Class Mail a Notice of Public Hearing to taxpayers of record within 250’ of the property in question. An Affidavit of Mailing executed by C & ED personne...
	The property in question is zoned C – 4 Regional Destination PUD Commercial. The 600 – 602 property is improved with a one-story brick building and an existing 127’ telecommunications tower on the northeast portion of the site. The applicant seeks a c...
	DEPARTMENT COMMENTS:
	SUPPORTS THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE VILLAGE GOALS:
	Finance:  No comment.
	Police:
	1. After reviewing the petition, I do not see any impacts to public safety nor police services from the granting of the petition
	Engineering:
	1. No comments.
	Public Works:
	1.  No comments.
	Community & Economic Development:
	Economic Development
	1. Co – locating at a single site is preferable to separate sites.
	Code Compliance
	1. General Review Criteria
	1.
	B
	1. A full bu
	2. No Fire related issues.
	Building:
	1. Building permit review will be completed upon approval of the Village Board.
	Community Development
	1. The property in question falls within the C – 4 Regional Destination PUD Commercial District.
	2. The telecommunications tower in question is erected adjacent to the northwest corner of the existing 600 N. York Road building.
	3. A Conditional Use Permit was granted by the Village to MCI Telecommunications in Ordinance #19-82 on June 3, 1982 for the construction of a telecommunications relay tower not to exceed the height of 125’.
	4. American Tower Corporation purchased the tower in 1998.
	5. In 2007, a Conditional Use Permit was granted for American Tower Corporation in Ordinance #65-2007 to add twelve (12) antennae and one equipment shelter to an existing telecommunications tower and site, respectively.
	6. More recently the Village approved ordinance #83 – 2012 (copy attached)an amendment to  the 2007 Ordinance to include the installation of an antenna at the top of the 125’ tower bringing the overall structural height to 127’as it exceeds the maximu...
	7. Staff does not object to the additional antennas at this location.
	APPROVAL CRITERIA FOR CONDITIONAL USES:
	The Community Development Commission shall not recommend approval of the Conditional Use Permit without determining that the request meets the following approval criteria and making certain findings of fact.  Staff has reviewed the request and recomme...
	The review and recommendation of the Conditional Use Permit should be determined by the “Approval Criteria” found in the Village’s Zoning Ordinance.
	Staff finds all Approval Criteria have been met.
	Staff recommends the approval of the above Findings of Fact and the Conditional Use Permit Amendment subject to the following conditions:
	1. The Conditional Use Permit Amendment be granted solely to American Towers, Inc. and shall be transferred only after a review by the Community Development Commission (CDC) and approval of the Village Board. In the event of the sale or lease of this ...
	2. The property shall be developed and utilized in substantial conformance to the plans submitted as part of this application prepared by Fullerton Engineering Design dated 03.25.13 last revised 04.01.13
	Respectfully Submitted,
	Department of Community
	& Economic Development


	061113 IE - Final - DR
	1 - 061113 I E Agenda
	2 - May 21, 2013 I&E Minutes
	3 - 01_GS_Garbage_6-4-13
	4 - 02_AlliedProposal
	5 - 03_CPI-T

	061113 Public Safety - Final - DR
	1 - 061113 Public Safety Agenda.New
	2 - DRAFT_130521 _ Public Safety Committee Minutes
	3 - 01_GS_VideoGamingReferendum_6-11-13
	4 - 02_VideoGamingMap
	5 - 03_VideoGaming_PPT_V3
	Provisions of the Act
	Enforcement
	Potential Establishments In Bensenville
	Revenue Sharing
	Municipal Revenue Projections

	6 - 04_FAQsforVideoGaming
	7 - 1_Taqueria_LL_Discussion_GS
	8 - 2_LL_June_2013
	Sheet1

	9 - 3_Taqueria_Mi_Tierra_LL_Application
	10 - Main_Street_LL_Discussion_GS
	11 - 2_LL_June_2013
	Sheet1

	12 - 3_Main_Street_News_Stand_LL_Application

	061113 CED - Final - DR
	1 - 061113 - CEDC Agenda
	2 - DRAFT_130521_Community and Economic Development Committee Minutes
	3 - Item 1 RETI Green Sheet
	4  - Item 2 06.05.13  RETI Staff Memo
	5 - Item 1 Green Sheet Facade Program
	6 - Item 2  Facade and Exterior Enhancement Grant Program Staff Memo
	7 - Item 1 06.11.13 Green Sheet Accessory Structures
	8 - Item 2 06.05.13 Staff Memo  Accessory Structures




